Bid Download Report By Bid Amount

Proposal: 01-0H1604 Call order: 1 Number of bids received: 6

Bidder ID	Vendor Name
VC000000213	Granite Construction Company
VC0000017652	Argonaut Constructors
VC0000017554	Ghilotti Bros., Inc.
VC000003985	Mercer-Fraser Company
VC000007021	G R Sundberg, Inc.
VC0000014187	Ghilotti Construction Co.

Letting ID: 01-0H1604 Letting Date: 04/18/2023 Contract ID: 01-0H1604 Vendor Name: Granite Construction Company Cost total: \$23,216,265.60 Days bid: 165 days @ \$13200.00 Cost Per Day Time total: \$2,178,000.00 Bid Amount (Cost+Time): \$25,394,265.60 NOTE: DAYS BID, COST PER DAY, AND TIME TOTAL ARE ONLY REPORTED ON COST + TIME PROJECTS Description: CONSTRUCTION ON STATE HIGHWAY IN MENDOCINO COUNTY NEAR WILLITS FROM 1.1 MILES NORTH OF WEST ROAD OVERCROSSING TO 0.6 MILE SOUTH OF HAEHL CREEK BRIDGE In District 01 On Route 101 CallOrder: 1 Project ID: 0117000117 Amendments: 1 Bid Error Flag: No Bid Errors: Bid Modification Checksum: A7E9ECB769 Bid Creation Checksum: plvqc5hzEloIvNGbWhCizW46MU1Ujb7HBL1ktKxJuhM= Bid Security: Electronic Bidder's Bond License #: 89 California Company, Small Business and Non-Small Business preferences are not applied on Federally funded projects

Small Business Preference: Non-Small Business Preference: California Company Preference: not No

Letting ID: 01-0H1604 Letting Date: 04/18/2023 Contract ID: 01-0H1604 Vendor Name: Argonaut Constructors Cost total: \$24,734,441.00 Days bid: 165 days @ \$13200.00 Cost Per Day Time total: \$2,178,000.00 Bid Amount (Cost+Time): \$26,912,441.00 NOTE: DAYS BID, COST PER DAY, AND TIME TOTAL ARE ONLY REPORTED ON COST + TIME PROJECTS Description: CONSTRUCTION ON STATE HIGHWAY IN MENDOCINO COUNTY NEAR WILLITS FROM 1.1 MILES NORTH OF WEST ROAD OVERCROSSING TO 0.6 MILE SOUTH OF HAEHL CREEK BRIDGE In District 01 On Route 101 CallOrder: 1 Project ID: 0117000117 Amendments: 1 Bid Error Flag: No Bid Errors: Bid Modification Checksum: 05A4500244 Bid Creation Checksum: plvqc5hzEloIvNGbWhCizW46MU1Ujb7HBL1ktKxJuhM= Bid Security: Electronic Bidder's Bond License #: 171432 California Company, Small Business and Non-Small Business preferences are not applied on Federally funded projects Small Business Preference:

Letting ID: 01-0H1604 Letting Date: 04/18/2023 Contract ID: 01-0H1604 Vendor Name: Ghilotti Bros., Inc. Cost total: \$26,958,335.00 Days bid: 165 days @ \$13200.00 Cost Per Day Time total: \$2,178,000.00 Bid Amount (Cost+Time): \$29,136,335.00 NOTE: DAYS BID, COST PER DAY, AND TIME TOTAL ARE ONLY REPORTED ON COST + TIME PROJECTS Description: CONSTRUCTION ON STATE HIGHWAY IN MENDOCINO COUNTY NEAR WILLITS FROM 1.1 MILES NORTH OF WEST ROAD OVERCROSSING TO 0.6 MILE SOUTH OF HAEHL CREEK BRIDGE In District 01 On Route 101 CallOrder: 1 Project ID: 0117000117 Amendments: 1 Bid Error Flag: No Bid Errors: Bid Modification Checksum: BCD24864D4 Bid Creation Checksum: plvqc5hzEloIvNGbWhCizW46MU1Ujb7HBL1ktKxJuhM= Bid Security: Electronic Bidder's Bond License #: 132128 California Company, Small Business and Non-Small Business preferences are not applied on Federally funded projects Small Business Preference:

Letting ID: 01-0H1604 Letting Date: 04/18/2023 Contract ID: 01-0H1604 Vendor Name: Mercer-Fraser Company Cost total: \$27,857,857.00 Days bid: 165 days @ \$13200.00 Cost Per Day Time total: \$2,178,000.00 Bid Amount (Cost+Time): \$30,035,857.00 NOTE: DAYS BID, COST PER DAY, AND TIME TOTAL ARE ONLY REPORTED ON COST + TIME PROJECTS Description: CONSTRUCTION ON STATE HIGHWAY IN MENDOCINO COUNTY NEAR WILLITS FROM 1.1 MILES NORTH OF WEST ROAD OVERCROSSING TO 0.6 MILE SOUTH OF HAEHL CREEK BRIDGE In District 01 On Route 101 CallOrder: 1 Project ID: 0117000117 Amendments: 1 Bid Error Flag: No Bid Errors: Bid Modification Checksum: B41E2C94DE Bid Creation Checksum: plvqc5hzEloIvNGbWhCizW46MU1Ujb7HBL1ktKxJuhM= Bid Security: Electronic Bidder's Bond License #: 105709 California Company, Small Business and Non-Small Business preferences are not applied on Federally funded projects Small Business Preference:

Letting ID: 01-0H1604 Letting Date: 04/18/2023 Contract ID: 01-0H1604 Vendor Name: G R Sundberg, Inc. Cost total: \$27,941,955.20 Days bid: 165 days @ \$13200.00 Cost Per Day Time total: \$2,178,000.00 Bid Amount (Cost+Time): \$30,119,955.20 NOTE: DAYS BID, COST PER DAY, AND TIME TOTAL ARE ONLY REPORTED ON COST + TIME PROJECTS Description: CONSTRUCTION ON STATE HIGHWAY IN MENDOCINO COUNTY NEAR WILLITS FROM 1.1 MILES NORTH OF WEST ROAD OVERCROSSING TO 0.6 MILE SOUTH OF HAEHL CREEK BRIDGE In District 01 On Route 101 CallOrder: 1 Project ID: 0117000117 Amendments: 1 Bid Error Flag: No Bid Errors: Bid Modification Checksum: FA9D6B347D Bid Creation Checksum: plvqc5hzEloIvNGbWhCizW46MU1Ujb7HBL1ktKxJuhM= Bid Security: Electronic Bidder's Bond License #: 732695 California Company, Small Business and Non-Small Business preferences are not applied on Federally funded projects Small Business Preference:

Letting ID: 01-0H1604 Letting Date: 04/18/2023 Contract ID: 01-0H1604 Vendor Name: Ghilotti Construction Co. Cost total: \$28,048,051.45 Days bid: 165 days @ \$13200.00 Cost Per Day Time total: \$2,178,000.00 Bid Amount (Cost+Time): \$30,226,051.45 NOTE: DAYS BID, COST PER DAY, AND TIME TOTAL ARE ONLY REPORTED ON COST + TIME PROJECTS Description: CONSTRUCTION ON STATE HIGHWAY IN MENDOCINO COUNTY NEAR WILLITS FROM 1.1 MILES NORTH OF WEST ROAD OVERCROSSING TO 0.6 MILE SOUTH OF HAEHL CREEK BRIDGE In District 01 On Route 101 CallOrder: 1 Project ID: 0117000117 Amendments: 1 Bid Error Flag: No Bid Errors: Bid Modification Checksum: 806DF14017 Bid Creation Checksum: plvqc5hzEloIvNGbWhCizW46MU1Ujb7HBL1ktKxJuhM= Bid Security: Electronic Bidder's Bond License #: 644515 California Company, Small Business and Non-Small Business preferences are not applied on Federally funded projects Small Business Preference:

Bid Download Report By Bid Amount

Proposal: 03-2G6704 Call order: 1 Number of bids received: 6

Bidder ID	Vendor Name
VC1900001581	Lamassu Utility Services, Inc.
VC1600003207	SAK Construction, LLC
VC1200004067	Wylatti Resource Management, Inc
VC1400002898	Roll'n Rock Construction Inc
VC1500002909	Jabre Contracting Inc.
VC0000013407	G B A Engineering

Letting ID: 03-2G6704 Letting Date: 04/18/2023 Contract ID: 03-2G6704 Vendor Name: Lamassu Utility Services, Inc. Cost total: \$178,403.34 Days bid: days @ \$ Cost Per Day Time total: \$0.00 Bid Amount (Cost+Time): \$178,403.34 NOTE: DAYS BID, COST PER DAY, AND TIME TOTAL ARE ONLY REPORTED ON COST + TIME PROJECTS Description: CONSTRUCTION ON STATE HIGHWAY IN EL DORADO COUNTY NEAR PLYMOUTH AT VARIOUS LOCATIONS FROM AMADOR COUNTY LINE TO 1.0 MILE SOUTH OF SAND RIDGE ROAD In District 03 On Route 49 CallOrder: 1 Project ID: 0322000135 Amendments: Bid Error Flag: No Bid Errors: Bid Modification Checksum: 8831DCBEDA Bid Creation Checksum: +rtXNRPMLNIFASfpQaSC/f750Asy3kJT9xZkuc8+lyU= Bid Security: Bidder's Bond License #: 1017757 California Company, Small Business and Non-Small Business preferences are not applied on Federally funded projects Small Business Preference:requests

Letting ID: 03-2G6704 Letting Date: 04/18/2023 Contract ID: 03-2G6704 Vendor Name: SAK Construction, LLC Cost total: \$184,712.00 Days bid: days @ \$ Cost Per Day Time total: \$0.00 Bid Amount (Cost+Time): \$184,712.00 NOTE: DAYS BID, COST PER DAY, AND TIME TOTAL ARE ONLY REPORTED ON COST + TIME PROJECTS Description: CONSTRUCTION ON STATE HIGHWAY IN EL DORADO COUNTY NEAR PLYMOUTH AT VARIOUS LOCATIONS FROM AMADOR COUNTY LINE TO 1.0 MILE SOUTH OF SAND RIDGE ROAD In District 03 On Route 49 CallOrder: 1 Project ID: 0322000135 Amendments: Bid Error Flag: No Bid Errors: Bid Modification Checksum: 3560ADD3B7 Bid Creation Checksum: +rtXNRPMLNIFASfpQaSC/f750Asy3kJT9xZkuc8+lyU= Bid Security: Electronic Bidder's Bond License #: 984560 California Company, Small Business and Non-Small Business preferences are not applied on Federally funded projects

Small Business Preference: Non-Small Business Preference: California Company Preference: not No

Letting ID: 03-2G6704 Letting Date: 04/18/2023 Contract ID: 03-2G6704 Vendor Name: Wylatti Resource Management, Inc Cost total: \$207,843.97 Days bid: days @ \$ Cost Per Day Time total: \$0.00 Bid Amount (Cost+Time): \$207,843.97 NOTE: DAYS BID, COST PER DAY, AND TIME TOTAL ARE ONLY REPORTED ON COST + TIME PROJECTS Description: CONSTRUCTION ON STATE HIGHWAY IN EL DORADO COUNTY NEAR PLYMOUTH AT VARIOUS LOCATIONS FROM AMADOR COUNTY LINE TO 1.0 MILE SOUTH OF SAND RIDGE ROAD In District 03 On Route 49 CallOrder: 1 Project ID: 0322000135 Amendments: Bid Error Flag: No Bid Errors: Bid Modification Checksum: 2414F0148C Bid Creation Checksum: +rtXNRPMLNIFASfpQaSC/f750Asy3kJT9xZkuc8+lyU= Bid Security: Electronic Bidder's Bond License #: 934597 California Company, Small Business and Non-Small Business preferences are not applied on Federally funded projects Small Business Preference:requests

Letting ID: 03-2G6704 Letting Date: 04/18/2023 Contract ID: 03-2G6704 Vendor Name: Roll'n Rock Construction Inc Cost total: \$218,975.00 Days bid: days @ \$ Cost Per Day Time total: \$0.00 Bid Amount (Cost+Time): \$218,975.00 NOTE: DAYS BID, COST PER DAY, AND TIME TOTAL ARE ONLY REPORTED ON COST + TIME PROJECTS Description: CONSTRUCTION ON STATE HIGHWAY IN EL DORADO COUNTY NEAR PLYMOUTH AT VARIOUS LOCATIONS FROM AMADOR COUNTY LINE TO 1.0 MILE SOUTH OF SAND RIDGE ROAD In District 03 On Route 49 CallOrder: 1 Project ID: 0322000135 Amendments: Bid Error Flag: No Bid Errors: Bid Modification Checksum: 2CA17EA292 Bid Creation Checksum: +rtXNRPMLNIFASfpQaSC/f750Asy3kJT9xZkuc8+lyU= Bid Security: Electronic Bidder's Bond License #: 971838 California Company, Small Business and Non-Small Business preferences are not applied on Federally funded projects Small Business Preference:requests

Letting ID: 03-2G6704 Letting Date: 04/18/2023 Contract ID: 03-2G6704 Vendor Name: Jabre Contracting Inc. Cost total: \$251,679.00 Days bid: days @ \$ Cost Per Day Time total: \$0.00 Bid Amount (Cost+Time): \$251,679.00 NOTE: DAYS BID, COST PER DAY, AND TIME TOTAL ARE ONLY REPORTED ON COST + TIME PROJECTS Description: CONSTRUCTION ON STATE HIGHWAY IN EL DORADO COUNTY NEAR PLYMOUTH AT VARIOUS LOCATIONS FROM AMADOR COUNTY LINE TO 1.0 MILE SOUTH OF SAND RIDGE ROAD In District 03 On Route 49 CallOrder: 1 Project ID: 0322000135 Amendments: Bid Error Flag: No Bid Errors: Bid Modification Checksum: BC13F551DB Bid Creation Checksum: +rtXNRPMLNIFASfpQaSC/f750Asy3kJT9xZkuc8+lyU= Bid Security: Electronic Bidder's Bond License #: 981190 California Company, Small Business and Non-Small Business preferences are not applied on Federally funded projects Small Business Preference:requests

Letting ID: 03-2G6704 Letting Date: 04/18/2023 Contract ID: 03-2G6704 Vendor Name: G B A Engineering Cost total: \$257,668.00 Days bid: days @ \$ Cost Per Day Time total: \$0.00 Bid Amount (Cost+Time): \$257,668.00 NOTE: DAYS BID, COST PER DAY, AND TIME TOTAL ARE ONLY REPORTED ON COST + TIME PROJECTS Description: CONSTRUCTION ON STATE HIGHWAY IN EL DORADO COUNTY NEAR PLYMOUTH AT VARIOUS LOCATIONS FROM AMADOR COUNTY LINE TO 1.0 MILE SOUTH OF SAND RIDGE ROAD In District 03 On Route 49 CallOrder: 1 Project ID: 0322000135 Amendments: Bid Error Flag: No Bid Errors: Bid Modification Checksum: 6728D3EA16 Bid Creation Checksum: +rtXNRPMLNIFASfpQaSC/f750Asy3kJT9xZkuc8+lyU= Bid Security: Electronic Bidder's Bond License #: 900340 California Company, Small Business and Non-Small Business preferences are not applied on Federally funded projects Small Business Preference:requests

Bid Download Report By Bid Amount

Proposal: 03-2G8504 Call order: 1 Number of bids received: 6

Bidder ID	Vendor Name
VC1700004300	Centerline Striping Company Inc.
VC230000087	Sterndahl Enterprises LLC
VC000003696	Central Striping Service, Inc.
VC0000018985	Chrisp Company
VC000008079	Pave-Tech Inc.
VC2200003773	Specialized Pavement Marking, LLC

Letting ID: 03-2G8504 Letting Date: 04/18/2023 Contract ID: 03-2G8504 Vendor Name: Centerline Striping Company Inc. Cost total: \$1,166,970.00 Days bid: 90 days @ \$4200.00 Cost Per Day Time total: \$378,000.00 Bid Amount (Cost+Time): \$1,544,970.00 NOTE: DAYS BID, COST PER DAY, AND TIME TOTAL ARE ONLY REPORTED ON COST + TIME PROJECTS Description: CONSTRUCTION ON STATE HIGHWAY IN SACRAMENTO, SUTTER, AND YUBA COUNTIES AT VARIOUS LOCATIONS In District 03 On Route 5,51,65,70,80,99 CallOrder: 1 Project ID: 0322000246 Amendments: Bid Error Flag: No Bid Errors: Bid Modification Checksum: A4D372A0C7 Bid Creation Checksum: EKZUyTndFeBTjqwvO3GMPq3aQSebziWndnxSjIo+N9I= Bid Security: Electronic Bidder's Bond License #: 499345 California Company, Small Business and Non-Small Business preferences are not applied on Federally funded projects Small Business Preference: Non-Small Business Preference:requests California Company Preference: not No

Letting ID: 03-2G8504 Letting Date: 04/18/2023 Contract ID: 03-2G8504 Vendor Name: Sterndahl Enterprises LLC Cost total: \$1,615,275.00 Days bid: 65 days @ \$4200.00 Cost Per Day Time total: \$273,000.00 Bid Amount (Cost+Time): \$1,888,275.00 NOTE: DAYS BID, COST PER DAY, AND TIME TOTAL ARE ONLY REPORTED ON COST + TIME PROJECTS Description: CONSTRUCTION ON STATE HIGHWAY IN SACRAMENTO, SUTTER, AND YUBA COUNTIES AT VARIOUS LOCATIONS In District 03 On Route 5,51,65,70,80,99 CallOrder: 1 Project ID: 0322000246 Amendments: Bid Error Flag: No Bid Errors: Bid Modification Checksum: 6F8D7074A9 Bid Creation Checksum: EKZUyTndFeBTjqwvO3GMPq3aQSebziWndnxSjIo+N9I= Bid Security: Electronic Bidder's Bond License #: 421823 California Company, Small Business and Non-Small Business preferences are not applied on Federally funded projects Small Business Preference:requests Non-Small Business Preference: California Company Preference: not No

Letting ID: 03-2G8504 Letting Date: 04/18/2023 Contract ID: 03-2G8504 Vendor Name: Central Striping Service, Inc. Cost total: \$1,776,777.07 Days bid: 65 days @ \$4200.00 Cost Per Day Time total: \$273,000.00 Bid Amount (Cost+Time): \$2,049,777.07 NOTE: DAYS BID, COST PER DAY, AND TIME TOTAL ARE ONLY REPORTED ON COST + TIME PROJECTS Description: CONSTRUCTION ON STATE HIGHWAY IN SACRAMENTO, SUTTER, AND YUBA COUNTIES AT VARIOUS LOCATIONS In District 03 On Route 5,51,65,70,80,99 CallOrder: 1 Project ID: 0322000246 Amendments: Bid Error Flag: No Bid Errors: Bid Modification Checksum: DD07F0323C Bid Creation Checksum: EKZUyTndFeBTjqwvO3GMPq3aQSebziWndnxSjIo+N9I= Bid Security: Electronic Bidder's Bond License #: 403896 California Company, Small Business and Non-Small Business preferences are not applied on Federally funded projects Small Business Preference:requests Non-Small Business Preference:

California Company Preference: not No

Letting ID: 03-2G8504 Letting Date: 04/18/2023 Contract ID: 03-2G8504 Vendor Name: Chrisp Company Cost total: \$1,862,905.00 Days bid: 90 days @ \$4200.00 Cost Per Day Time total: \$378,000.00 Bid Amount (Cost+Time): \$2,240,905.00 NOTE: DAYS BID, COST PER DAY, AND TIME TOTAL ARE ONLY REPORTED ON COST + TIME PROJECTS Description: CONSTRUCTION ON STATE HIGHWAY IN SACRAMENTO, SUTTER, AND YUBA COUNTIES AT VARIOUS LOCATIONS In District 03 On Route 5,51,65,70,80,99 CallOrder: 1 Project ID: 0322000246 Amendments: Bid Error Flag: No Bid Errors: Bid Modification Checksum: D253421E44 Bid Creation Checksum: EKZUyTndFeBTjqwvO3GMPq3aQSebziWndnxSjIo+N9I= Bid Security: Electronic Bidder's Bond License #: 374600 California Company, Small Business and Non-Small Business preferences are not applied on Federally funded projects Small Business Preference: Non-Small Business Preference: California Company Preference: not No

Letting ID: 03-2G8504 Letting Date: 04/18/2023 Contract ID: 03-2G8504 Vendor Name: Pave-Tech Inc. Cost total: \$2,424,000.00 Days bid: 65 days @ \$4200.00 Cost Per Day Time total: \$273,000.00 Bid Amount (Cost+Time): \$2,697,000.00 NOTE: DAYS BID, COST PER DAY, AND TIME TOTAL ARE ONLY REPORTED ON COST + TIME PROJECTS Description: CONSTRUCTION ON STATE HIGHWAY IN SACRAMENTO, SUTTER, AND YUBA COUNTIES AT VARIOUS LOCATIONS In District 03 On Route 5,51,65,70,80,99 CallOrder: 1 Project ID: 0322000246 Amendments: Bid Error Flag: No Bid Errors: Bid Modification Checksum: 0C29A47F72 Bid Creation Checksum: EKZUyTndFeBTjqwvO3GMPq3aQSebziWndnxSjIo+N9I= Bid Security: Electronic Bidder's Bond License #: 720394 California Company, Small Business and Non-Small Business preferences are not applied on Federally funded projects Small Business Preference: Non-Small Business Preference: California Company Preference: not No

Letting ID: 03-2G8504 Letting Date: 04/18/2023 Contract ID: 03-2G8504 Vendor Name: Specialized Pavement Marking, LLC Cost total: \$2,491,854.62 Days bid: 65 days @ \$4200.00 Cost Per Day Time total: \$273,000.00 Bid Amount (Cost+Time): \$2,764,854.62 NOTE: DAYS BID, COST PER DAY, AND TIME TOTAL ARE ONLY REPORTED ON COST + TIME PROJECTS Description: CONSTRUCTION ON STATE HIGHWAY IN SACRAMENTO, SUTTER, AND YUBA COUNTIES AT VARIOUS LOCATIONS In District 03 On Route 5,51,65,70,80,99 CallOrder: 1 Project ID: 0322000246 Amendments: Bid Error Flag: No Bid Errors: Bid Modification Checksum: 3D942CC476 Bid Creation Checksum: EKZUyTndFeBTjqwvO3GMPq3aQSebziWndnxSjIo+N9I= Bid Security: Electronic Bidder's Bond License #: 854894 California Company, Small Business and Non-Small Business preferences are not applied on Federally funded projects Small Business Preference: Non-Small Business Preference: California Company Preference: not No

Bid Download Report By Bid Amount

Proposal: 04-1W1204 Call order: 1 Number of bids received: 3

Bidder ID	Vendor Name
VC000009886	Golden State Bridge, Inc.
VC1700004388	American Civil Constructors West Coast LLC
VC0000020099	Bay Line Cutting & Coring Inc.

Letting ID: 04-1W1204 Letting Date: 04/18/2023 Contract ID: 04-1W1204 Vendor Name: Golden State Bridge, Inc. Cost total: \$1,920,966.75 Days bid: days @ \$ Cost Per Day Time total: \$0.00 Bid Amount (Cost+Time): \$1,920,966.75 NOTE: DAYS BID, COST PER DAY, AND TIME TOTAL ARE ONLY REPORTED ON COST + TIME PROJECTS Description: CONSTRUCTION ON STATE HIGHWAY IN ALAMEDA COUNTY IN PLEASANTON AT ROUTE 680/580 SEPARATION In District 04 On Route 680 CallOrder: 1 Project ID: 0420000331 Amendments: 1 Bid Error Flag: No Bid Errors: Bid Modification Checksum: F62D477F79 Bid Creation Checksum: Yt+pOUqD4/cYrvaowPat66IiAXfSiqkxSxOewSRo+W8= Bid Security: Electronic Bidder's Bond License #: 851187 California Company, Small Business and Non-Small Business preferences are not applied on Federally funded projects Small Business Preference:

Letting ID: 04-1W1204 Letting Date: 04/18/2023 Contract ID: 04-1W1204 Vendor Name: American Civil Constructors West Coast LLC Cost total: \$2,067,000.00 Days bid: days @ \$ Cost Per Day Time total: \$0.00 Bid Amount (Cost+Time): \$2,067,000.00 NOTE: DAYS BID, COST PER DAY, AND TIME TOTAL ARE ONLY REPORTED ON COST + TIME PROJECTS Description: CONSTRUCTION ON STATE HIGHWAY IN ALAMEDA COUNTY IN PLEASANTON AT ROUTE 680/580 SEPARATION In District 04 On Route 680 CallOrder: 1 Project ID: 0420000331 Amendments: 1 Bid Error Flag: No Bid Errors: Bid Modification Checksum: 7C53719CDC Bid Creation Checksum: Yt+pOUqD4/cYrvaowPat66IiAXfSiqkxSxOewSRo+W8= Bid Security: Electronic Bidder's Bond License #: 1011546 California Company, Small Business and Non-Small Business preferences are not applied on Federally funded projects

Small Business Preference: Non-Small Business Preference: California Company Preference: not No

Letting ID: 04-1W1204 Letting Date: 04/18/2023 Contract ID: 04-1W1204 Vendor Name: Bay Line Cutting & Coring Inc. Cost total: \$2,315,105.00 Days bid: days @ \$ Cost Per Day Time total: \$0.00 Bid Amount (Cost+Time): \$2,315,105.00 NOTE: DAYS BID, COST PER DAY, AND TIME TOTAL ARE ONLY REPORTED ON COST + TIME PROJECTS Description: CONSTRUCTION ON STATE HIGHWAY IN ALAMEDA COUNTY IN PLEASANTON AT ROUTE 680/580 SEPARATION In District 04 On Route 680 CallOrder: 1 Project ID: 0420000331 Amendments: 1 Bid Error Flag: No Bid Errors: Bid Modification Checksum: 55E1510058 Bid Creation Checksum: Yt+pOUqD4/cYrvaowPat66IiAXfSiqkxSxOewSRo+W8= Bid Security: Electronic Bidder's Bond License #: 809660 California Company, Small Business and Non-Small Business preferences are not applied on Federally funded projects

Small Business Preference:requests Non-Small Business Preference: California Company Preference: not No

Bid Download Report By Bid Amount

Proposal: 08-1H3904 Call order: 1 Number of bids received: 5

Bidder ID	Vendor Name
VC0000101310	Powell Constructors Inc
VC2100000452	Ragnar Benson, LLC
VC0000021515	C. A. Rasmussen, Inc.
VC1600001088	Guy F. Atkinson Construction, LLC
VC000008339	Sully-Miller Contracting Company

Letting ID: 08-1H3904 0418 Letting Date: 04/18/2023 Contract ID: 08-1H3904 Vendor Name: Powell Constructors Inc Cost total: \$25,227,230.00 Days bid: days @ \$ Cost Per Day Time total: \$0.00 Bid Amount (Cost+Time): \$25,227,230.00 NOTE: DAYS BID, COST PER DAY, AND TIME TOTAL ARE ONLY REPORTED ON COST + TIME PROJECTS Description: CONSTRUCTION ON STATE HIGHWAY IN SAN BERNARDINO COUNTY FROM 0.6 MILE NORTH OF CLEGHORN ROAD UNDERCROSSING TO 0.5 MILE SOUTH OF ROUTE 138 AND FROM 0.5 MILE SOUTH OF TRUCK SAFETY CHECK AREA TO 0.4 MILE NORTH OF OAK HILL ROAD OVERCROSSING In District 08 On Route 15 CallOrder: 1 Project ID: 0817000032 Amendments: 2 Bid Error Flag: No Bid Errors: Bid Modification Checksum: FA66842D25 Bid Creation Checksum: aKqrqCmw/IRtqLi9d5CkU74aFX/VlLNBMcYqv5jsIpM= Bid Security: Electronic Bidder's Bond License #: 845305 A California Company, Small Business and Non-Small Business preferences are not applied on Federally funded projects Small Business Preference: Non-Small Business Preference: California Company Preference: not No

Letting ID: 08-1H3904 0418 Letting Date: 04/18/2023 Contract ID: 08-1H3904 Vendor Name: Ragnar Benson, LLC Cost total: \$27,999,768.20 Days bid: days @ \$ Cost Per Day Time total: \$0.00 Bid Amount (Cost+Time): \$27,999,768.20 NOTE: DAYS BID, COST PER DAY, AND TIME TOTAL ARE ONLY REPORTED ON COST + TIME PROJECTS Description: CONSTRUCTION ON STATE HIGHWAY IN SAN BERNARDINO COUNTY FROM 0.6 MILE NORTH OF CLEGHORN ROAD UNDERCROSSING TO 0.5 MILE SOUTH OF ROUTE 138 AND FROM 0.5 MILE SOUTH OF TRUCK SAFETY CHECK AREA TO 0.4 MILE NORTH OF OAK HILL ROAD OVERCROSSING In District 08 On Route 15 CallOrder: 1 Project ID: 0817000032 Amendments: 2 Bid Error Flag: No Bid Errors: Bid Modification Checksum: A94B9E0529 Bid Creation Checksum: aKqrqCmw/IRtqLi9d5CkU74aFX/VlLNBMcYqv5jsIpM= Bid Security: Electronic Bidder's Bond License #: 1057074 California Company, Small Business and Non-Small Business preferences are not applied on Federally funded projects Small Business Preference: Non-Small Business Preference: California Company Preference: not No

Letting ID: 08-1H3904 0418 Letting Date: 04/18/2023 Contract ID: 08-1H3904 Vendor Name: C. A. Rasmussen, Inc. Cost total: \$28,296,109.80 Days bid: days @ \$ Cost Per Day Time total: \$0.00 Bid Amount (Cost+Time): \$28,296,109.80 NOTE: DAYS BID, COST PER DAY, AND TIME TOTAL ARE ONLY REPORTED ON COST + TIME PROJECTS Description: CONSTRUCTION ON STATE HIGHWAY IN SAN BERNARDINO COUNTY FROM 0.6 MILE NORTH OF CLEGHORN ROAD UNDERCROSSING TO 0.5 MILE SOUTH OF ROUTE 138 AND FROM 0.5 MILE SOUTH OF TRUCK SAFETY CHECK AREA TO 0.4 MILE NORTH OF OAK HILL ROAD OVERCROSSING In District 08 On Route 15 CallOrder: 1 Project ID: 0817000032 Amendments: 2 Bid Error Flag: No Bid Errors: Bid Modification Checksum: 17F9DF1447 Bid Creation Checksum: aKqrqCmw/IRtqLi9d5CkU74aFX/VlLNBMcYqv5jsIpM= Bid Security: Electronic Bidder's Bond License #: 254681 California Company, Small Business and Non-Small Business preferences are not applied on Federally funded projects Small Business Preference: Non-Small Business Preference: California Company Preference: not No

Letting ID: 08-1H3904 0418 Letting Date: 04/18/2023 Contract ID: 08-1H3904 Vendor Name: Guy F. Atkinson Construction, LLC Cost total: \$30,903,165.00 Days bid: days @ \$ Cost Per Day Time total: \$0.00 Bid Amount (Cost+Time): \$30,903,165.00 NOTE: DAYS BID, COST PER DAY, AND TIME TOTAL ARE ONLY REPORTED ON COST + TIME PROJECTS Description: CONSTRUCTION ON STATE HIGHWAY IN SAN BERNARDINO COUNTY FROM 0.6 MILE NORTH OF CLEGHORN ROAD UNDERCROSSING TO 0.5 MILE SOUTH OF ROUTE 138 AND FROM 0.5 MILE SOUTH OF TRUCK SAFETY CHECK AREA TO 0.4 MILE NORTH OF OAK HILL ROAD OVERCROSSING In District 08 On Route 15 CallOrder: 1 Project ID: 0817000032 Amendments: 2 Bid Error Flag: No Bid Errors: Bid Modification Checksum: 4D2E73A3C7 Bid Creation Checksum: aKqrqCmw/IRtqLi9d5CkU74aFX/VlLNBMcYqv5jsIpM= Bid Security: Electronic Bidder's Bond License #: 1004388 California Company, Small Business and Non-Small Business preferences are not applied on Federally funded projects Small Business Preference: Non-Small Business Preference: California Company Preference: not No

Letting ID: 08-1H3904 0418 Letting Date: 04/18/2023 Contract ID: 08-1H3904 Vendor Name: Sully-Miller Contracting Company Cost total: \$32,486,378.50 Days bid: days @ \$ Cost Per Day Time total: \$0.00 Bid Amount (Cost+Time): \$32,486,378.50 NOTE: DAYS BID, COST PER DAY, AND TIME TOTAL ARE ONLY REPORTED ON COST + TIME PROJECTS Description: CONSTRUCTION ON STATE HIGHWAY IN SAN BERNARDINO COUNTY FROM 0.6 MILE NORTH OF CLEGHORN ROAD UNDERCROSSING TO 0.5 MILE SOUTH OF ROUTE 138 AND FROM 0.5 MILE SOUTH OF TRUCK SAFETY CHECK AREA TO 0.4 MILE NORTH OF OAK HILL ROAD OVERCROSSING In District 08 On Route 15 CallOrder: 1 Project ID: 0817000032 Amendments: 2 Bid Error Flag: No Bid Errors: Bid Modification Checksum: 76472A48AC Bid Creation Checksum: aKqrqCmw/IRtqLi9d5CkU74aFX/VlLNBMcYqv5jsIpM= Bid Security: Electronic Bidder's Bond License #: 747612 California Company, Small Business and Non-Small Business preferences are not applied on Federally funded projects Small Business Preference: Non-Small Business Preference: California Company Preference: not No

Bid Download Report By Bid Amount

Proposal: 08-1J6704 Call order: 1 Number of bids received: 3

Bidder ID	Vendor Name
VC000008361	Beador Construction Company, Inc.
VC0000021468	DBX, Inc.
VC2100000646	FEC Future Contractors and Engineers, Inc.

Letting ID: 08-1J6704 Letting Date: 04/18/2023 Contract ID: 08-1J6704 Vendor Name: Beador Construction Company, Inc. Cost total: \$2,093,300.00 Days bid: days @ \$ Cost Per Day Time total: \$0.00 Bid Amount (Cost+Time): \$2,093,300.00 NOTE: DAYS BID, COST PER DAY, AND TIME TOTAL ARE ONLY REPORTED ON COST + TIME PROJECTS Description: CONSTRUCTION ON STATE HIGHWAY IN RIVERSIDE COUNTY IN MURRIETA AND WILDOMAR AT VARIOUS LOCATIONS FROM 0.1 MILE SOUTH OF MURRIETA HOT SPRINGS ROAD OVERCROSSING TO BUNDY CANYON ROAD UNDERCROSSING. In District 08 On Route 15 CallOrder: 1 Project ID: 0818000090 Amendments: 1 Bid Error Flag: No Bid Errors: Bid Modification Checksum: 15FFAEEFA0 Bid Creation Checksum: CnVXEOs2IfDqDyUQdl2M7Q6AJtAsz8RbtUfxIVhiZUo= Bid Security: Electronic Bidder's Bond License #: 720483 California Company, Small Business and Non-Small Business preferences are not applied on Federally funded projects Small Business Preference: Non-Small Business Preference: California Company Preference: not No

Letting ID: 08-1J6704 Letting Date: 04/18/2023 Contract ID: 08-1J6704 Vendor Name: DBX, Inc. Cost total: \$2,355,136.00 Days bid: days @ \$ Cost Per Day Time total: \$0.00 Bid Amount (Cost+Time): \$2,355,136.00 NOTE: DAYS BID, COST PER DAY, AND TIME TOTAL ARE ONLY REPORTED ON COST + TIME PROJECTS Description: CONSTRUCTION ON STATE HIGHWAY IN RIVERSIDE COUNTY IN MURRIETA AND WILDOMAR AT VARIOUS LOCATIONS FROM 0.1 MILE SOUTH OF MURRIETA HOT SPRINGS ROAD OVERCROSSING TO BUNDY CANYON ROAD UNDERCROSSING. In District 08 On Route 15 CallOrder: 1 Project ID: 0818000090 Amendments: 1 Bid Error Flag: No Bid Errors: Bid Modification Checksum: CC49E1BD93 Bid Creation Checksum: CnVXEOs2IfDqDyUQdl2M7Q6AJtAsz8RbtUfxIVhiZUo= Bid Security: Electronic Bidder's Bond License #: 240547 California Company, Small Business and Non-Small Business preferences are not applied on Federally funded projects Small Business Preference: Non-Small Business Preference: California Company Preference: not No

Letting ID: 08-1J6704 Letting Date: 04/18/2023 Contract ID: 08-1J6704 Vendor Name: FEC Future Contractors and Engineers, Inc. Cost total: \$2,937,911.62 Days bid: days @ \$ Cost Per Day Time total: \$0.00 Bid Amount (Cost+Time): \$2,937,911.62 NOTE: DAYS BID, COST PER DAY, AND TIME TOTAL ARE ONLY REPORTED ON COST + TIME PROJECTS Description: CONSTRUCTION ON STATE HIGHWAY IN RIVERSIDE COUNTY IN MURRIETA AND WILDOMAR AT VARIOUS LOCATIONS FROM 0.1 MILE SOUTH OF MURRIETA HOT SPRINGS ROAD OVERCROSSING TO BUNDY CANYON ROAD UNDERCROSSING. In District 08 On Route 15 CallOrder: 1 Project ID: 0818000090 Amendments: 1 Bid Error Flag: No Bid Errors: Bid Modification Checksum: 414ECE89F2 Bid Creation Checksum: CnVXEOs2IfDqDyUQdl2M7Q6AJtAsz8RbtUfxIVhiZUo= Bid Security: Electronic Bidder's Bond License #: 959988 California Company, Small Business and Non-Small Business preferences are not applied on Federally funded projects Small Business Preference: Non-Small Business Preference: California Company Preference: not No

Bid Download Report By Bid Amount

Proposal: 11-2N1214 Call order: 1 Number of bids received: 4

Bidder ID	Vendor Name
VC0000101052	Intermountain Slurry Seal, Inc.
VC1300003799	VSS International, Inc.
VC0000021841	Pavement Coatings Co
VC2100000646	FEC Future Contractors and Engineers, Inc.

Letting ID: 11-2N1214 Letting Date: 04/18/2023 Contract ID: 11-2N1214 Vendor Name: Intermountain Slurry Seal, Inc. Cost total: \$2,327,858.00 Days bid: days @ \$ Cost Per Day Time total: \$0.00 Bid Amount (Cost+Time): \$2,327,858.00 NOTE: DAYS BID, COST PER DAY, AND TIME TOTAL ARE ONLY REPORTED ON COST + TIME PROJECTS Description: CONSTRUCTION ON STATE HIGHWAY IN SAN DIEGO NEAR POTRERO AND CANYON CITY FROM JUNCTION ROUTE 188 TO 3 MILES EAST OF CAMPO CREEK BRIDGE (BR NO. 57-0118) In District 11 On Route 94 CallOrder: 1 Project ID: 1121000171 Amendments: Bid Error Flag: No Bid Errors: Bid Modification Checksum: C218A7D931 Bid Creation Checksum: FMUI52hBN8d7ZJQtrpmDOfa5d494khmA8eM7P+K9WWM= Bid Security: Electronic Bidder's Bond License #: 462443 California Company, Small Business and Non-Small Business preferences are not applied on Federally funded projects

Small Business Preference: Non-Small Business Preference: California Company Preference: not No

Letting ID: 11-2N1214 Letting Date: 04/18/2023 Contract ID: 11-2N1214 Vendor Name: VSS International, Inc. Cost total: \$2,340,120.00 Days bid: days @ \$ Cost Per Day Time total: \$0.00 Bid Amount (Cost+Time): \$2,340,120.00 NOTE: DAYS BID, COST PER DAY, AND TIME TOTAL ARE ONLY REPORTED ON COST + TIME PROJECTS Description: CONSTRUCTION ON STATE HIGHWAY IN SAN DIEGO NEAR POTRERO AND CANYON CITY FROM JUNCTION ROUTE 188 TO 3 MILES EAST OF CAMPO CREEK BRIDGE (BR NO. 57-0118) In District 11 On Route 94 CallOrder: 1 Project ID: 1121000171 Amendments: Bid Error Flag: No Bid Errors: Bid Modification Checksum: C9D640F189 Bid Creation Checksum: FMUI52hBN8d7ZJQtrpmDOfa5d494khmA8eM7P+K9WWM= Bid Security: Electronic Bidder's Bond License #: 293727 California Company, Small Business and Non-Small Business preferences are not applied on Federally funded projects Small Business Preference:

Letting ID: 11-2N1214 Letting Date: 04/18/2023 Contract ID: 11-2N1214 Vendor Name: Pavement Coatings Co Cost total: \$2,548,937.10 Days bid: days @ \$ Cost Per Day Time total: \$0.00 Bid Amount (Cost+Time): \$2,548,937.10 NOTE: DAYS BID, COST PER DAY, AND TIME TOTAL ARE ONLY REPORTED ON COST + TIME PROJECTS Description: CONSTRUCTION ON STATE HIGHWAY IN SAN DIEGO NEAR POTRERO AND CANYON CITY FROM JUNCTION ROUTE 188 TO 3 MILES EAST OF CAMPO CREEK BRIDGE (BR NO. 57-0118) In District 11 On Route 94 CallOrder: 1 Project ID: 1121000171 Amendments: Bid Error Flag: No Bid Errors: Bid Modification Checksum: CBDC3070BC Bid Creation Checksum: FMUI52hBN8d7ZJQtrpmDOfa5d494khmA8eM7P+K9WWM= Bid Security: Electronic Bidder's Bond License #: 303609 California Company, Small Business and Non-Small Business preferences are not applied on Federally funded projects Small Business Preference:

Letting ID: 11-2N1214 Letting Date: 04/18/2023 Contract ID: 11-2N1214 Vendor Name: FEC Future Contractors and Engineers, Inc. Cost total: \$3,097,544.80 Days bid: days @ \$ Cost Per Day Time total: \$0.00 Bid Amount (Cost+Time): \$3,097,544.80 NOTE: DAYS BID, COST PER DAY, AND TIME TOTAL ARE ONLY REPORTED ON COST + TIME PROJECTS Description: CONSTRUCTION ON STATE HIGHWAY IN SAN DIEGO NEAR POTRERO AND CANYON CITY FROM JUNCTION ROUTE 188 TO 3 MILES EAST OF CAMPO CREEK BRIDGE (BR NO. 57-0118) In District 11 On Route 94 CallOrder: 1 Project ID: 1121000171 Amendments: Bid Error Flag: No Bid Errors: Bid Modification Checksum: 102EFED4B2 Bid Creation Checksum: FMUI52hBN8d7ZJQtrpmDOfa5d494khmA8eM7P+K9WWM= Bid Security: Electronic Bidder's Bond License #: 959988 California Company, Small Business and Non-Small Business preferences are not applied on Federally funded projects Small Business Preference:requests