Bid Download Report By Bid Amount

Proposal: 02-2J4904 Call order: 1 Number of bids received: 4

Bidder ID	Vendor Name
VC0000013860	Robert J. Frank Construction, Inc.
VC2000002246	St. Francis Electric, LLC
VC1700002193	Lee Contractors
VC2200003483	Studebaker Electric, Inc.

Letting ID: 02-2J4904 Letting Date: 04/26/2023 Contract ID: 02-2J4904 Vendor Name: Robert J. Frank Construction, Inc. Cost total: \$944,450.00 Days bid: days @ \$ Cost Per Day Time total: \$0.00 Bid Amount (Cost+Time): \$944,450.00 NOTE: DAYS BID, COST PER DAY, AND TIME TOTAL ARE ONLY REPORTED ON COST + TIME PROJECTS Description: CONSTRUCTION ON STATE HIGHWAY IN SHASTA COUNTY IN REDDING AT VARIOUS LOCATIONS FROM BUENAVENTURA BOULEVARD TO COURT STREET In District 02 On Route 299 CallOrder: 1 Project ID: 0221000084 Amendments: Bid Error Flag: No Bid Errors: Bid Modification Checksum: A306BAA7AA Bid Creation Checksum: BfY8PAqLordxb/DllqacARVu73YKjRMi+um2xAOQZcA= Bid Security: Electronic Bidder's Bond License #: 520207 California Company, Small Business and Non-Small Business preferences are not applied on Federally funded projects Small Business Preference:requests Non-Small Business Preference:

Letting ID: 02-2J4904 Letting Date: 04/26/2023 Contract ID: 02-2J4904 Vendor Name: St. Francis Electric, LLC Cost total: \$968,000.00 Days bid: days @ \$ Cost Per Day Time total: \$0.00 Bid Amount (Cost+Time): \$968,000.00 NOTE: DAYS BID, COST PER DAY, AND TIME TOTAL ARE ONLY REPORTED ON COST + TIME PROJECTS Description: CONSTRUCTION ON STATE HIGHWAY IN SHASTA COUNTY IN REDDING AT VARIOUS LOCATIONS FROM BUENAVENTURA BOULEVARD TO COURT STREET In District 02 On Route 299 CallOrder: 1 Project ID: 0221000084 Amendments: Bid Error Flag: No Bid Errors: Bid Modification Checksum: A9B935EE8D Bid Creation Checksum: BfY8PAqLordxb/DllqacARVu73YKjRMi+um2xAOQZcA= Bid Security: Bidder's Bond License #: 1003811 California Company, Small Business and Non-Small Business preferences are not applied on Federally funded projects Small Business Preference: Non-Small Business Preference:

Letting ID: 02-2J4904 Letting Date: 04/26/2023 Contract ID: 02-2J4904 Vendor Name: Lee Contractors Cost total: \$988,863.00 Days bid: days @ \$ Cost Per Day Time total: \$0.00 Bid Amount (Cost+Time): \$988,863.00 NOTE: DAYS BID, COST PER DAY, AND TIME TOTAL ARE ONLY REPORTED ON COST + TIME PROJECTS Description: CONSTRUCTION ON STATE HIGHWAY IN SHASTA COUNTY IN REDDING AT VARIOUS LOCATIONS FROM BUENAVENTURA BOULEVARD TO COURT STREET In District 02 On Route 299 CallOrder: 1 Project ID: 0221000084 Amendments: Bid Error Flag: No Bid Errors: Bid Modification Checksum: DE059FBEAA Bid Creation Checksum: BfY8PAqLordxb/DllqacARVu73YKjRMi+um2xAOQZcA= Bid Security: Electronic Bidder's Bond License #: 961702 California Company, Small Business and Non-Small Business preferences are not applied on Federally funded projects Small Business Preference:requests Non-Small Business Preference:

Letting ID: 02-2J4904 Letting Date: 04/26/2023 Contract ID: 02-2J4904 Vendor Name: Studebaker Electric, Inc. Cost total: \$1,517,997.60 Days bid: days @ \$ Cost Per Day Time total: \$0.00 Bid Amount (Cost+Time): \$1,517,997.60 NOTE: DAYS BID, COST PER DAY, AND TIME TOTAL ARE ONLY REPORTED ON COST + TIME PROJECTS Description: CONSTRUCTION ON STATE HIGHWAY IN SHASTA COUNTY IN REDDING AT VARIOUS LOCATIONS FROM BUENAVENTURA BOULEVARD TO COURT STREET In District 02 On Route 299 CallOrder: 1 Project ID: 0221000084 Amendments: Bid Error Flag: No Bid Errors: Bid Modification Checksum: B97A806A5A Bid Creation Checksum: BfY8PAqLordxb/DllqacARVu73YKjRMi+um2xAOQZcA= Bid Security: Electronic Bidder's Bond License #: 957296 California Company, Small Business and Non-Small Business preferences are not applied on Federally funded projects Small Business Preference: Non-Small Business Preference:

Bid Download Report By Bid Amount

Proposal: 02-3J8504 Call order: 1 Number of bids received: 3

Bidder ID	Vendor Name
VC1400003400	American Pavement Systems, Inc.
VC0000015345	Northwest Paving, Inc.
VC1300003799	VSS International, Inc.

Letting ID: 02-3J8504 Letting Date: 04/26/2023 Contract ID: 02-3J8504 Vendor Name: American Pavement Systems, Inc. Cost total: \$859,659.00 Days bid: days @ \$ Cost Per Day Time total: \$0.00 Bid Amount (Cost+Time): \$859,659.00 NOTE: DAYS BID, COST PER DAY, AND TIME TOTAL ARE ONLY REPORTED ON COST + TIME PROJECTS Description: CONSTRUCTION ON STATE HIGHWAY IN MODOC COUNTY NEAR ALTURAS FROM ROUTE 395 TO 0.2 MILE EAST OF COUNTY ROAD 58 In District 02 On Route 299 CallOrder: 1 Project ID: 0222000090 Amendments: Bid Error Flag: No Bid Errors: Bid Modification Checksum: 704B0845F4 Bid Creation Checksum: RQ0PZJNHFBW7sDHfY2fLocLimMDrm6zAsWX/zADAyhg= Bid Security: Electronic Bidder's Bond License #: 943792 California Company, Small Business and Non-Small Business preferences are not applied on Federally funded projects

Small Business Preference: Non-Small Business Preference: California Company Preference: not No

Letting ID: 02-3J8504 Letting Date: 04/26/2023 Contract ID: 02-3J8504 Vendor Name: Northwest Paving, Inc. Cost total: \$987,057.47 Days bid: days @ \$ Cost Per Day Time total: \$0.00 Bid Amount (Cost+Time): \$987,057.47 NOTE: DAYS BID, COST PER DAY, AND TIME TOTAL ARE ONLY REPORTED ON COST + TIME PROJECTS Description: CONSTRUCTION ON STATE HIGHWAY IN MODOC COUNTY NEAR ALTURAS FROM ROUTE 395 TO 0.2 MILE EAST OF COUNTY ROAD 58 In District 02 On Route 299 CallOrder: 1 Project ID: 0222000090 Amendments: Bid Error Flag: No Bid Errors: Bid Modification Checksum: 4C8203A5C5 Bid Creation Checksum: RQ0PZJNHFBW7sDHfY2fLocLimMDrm6zAsWX/zADAyhg= Bid Security: Electronic Bidder's Bond License #: 822126 California Company, Small Business and Non-Small Business preferences are not applied on Federally funded projects Small Business Preference:requests Non-Small Business Preference:

Letting ID: 02-3J8504 Letting Date: 04/26/2023 Contract ID: 02-3J8504 Vendor Name: VSS International, Inc. Cost total: \$1,049,325.00 Days bid: days @ \$ Cost Per Day Time total: \$0.00 Bid Amount (Cost+Time): \$1,049,325.00 NOTE: DAYS BID, COST PER DAY, AND TIME TOTAL ARE ONLY REPORTED ON COST + TIME PROJECTS Description: CONSTRUCTION ON STATE HIGHWAY IN MODOC COUNTY NEAR ALTURAS FROM ROUTE 395 TO 0.2 MILE EAST OF COUNTY ROAD 58 In District 02 On Route 299 CallOrder: 1 Project ID: 0222000090 Amendments: Bid Error Flag: No Bid Errors: Bid Modification Checksum: 011D9E17AB Bid Creation Checksum: RQ0PZJNHFBW7sDHfY2fLocLimMDrm6zAsWX/zADAyhg= Bid Security: Electronic Bidder's Bond License #: 293727 California Company, Small Business and Non-Small Business preferences are not applied on Federally funded projects Small Business Preference: Non-Small Business Preference:

Bid Download Report By Bid Amount

Proposal: 03-2G8804 Call order: 1 Number of bids received: 2

Bidder ID	Vendor Name
VC2200003483	Studebaker Electric, Inc.
VC2000002246	St. Francis Electric, LLC

Letting ID: 03-2G8804 Letting Date: 04/26/2023 Contract ID: 03-2G8804 Vendor Name: Studebaker Electric, Inc. Cost total: \$1,531,050.00 Days bid: days @ \$ Cost Per Day Time total: \$0.00 Bid Amount (Cost+Time): \$1,531,050.00 NOTE: DAYS BID, COST PER DAY, AND TIME TOTAL ARE ONLY REPORTED ON COST + TIME PROJECTS Description: CONSTRUCTION ON STATE HIGHWAY IN EL DORADO, PLACER, AND SACRAMENTO COUNTIES AT VARIOUS LOCATIONS In District 03 On Route 50, 80, 99 CallOrder: 1 Project ID: 0322000256 Amendments: 1 Bid Error Flag: No Bid Errors: Bid Modification Checksum: 801D589C70 Bid Creation Checksum: SOJUqcJq80q88mzG08cJWG3EGViOP5WqS9cj1uVqZhQ= Bid Security: Electronic Bidder's Bond License #: 957296 California Company, Small Business and Non-Small Business preferences are not applied on Federally funded projects Small Business Preference: Non-Small Business Preference:

Letting ID: 03-2G8804 Letting Date: 04/26/2023 Contract ID: 03-2G8804 Vendor Name: St. Francis Electric, LLC Cost total: \$1,796,000.00 Days bid: days @ \$ Cost Per Day Time total: \$0.00 Bid Amount (Cost+Time): \$1,796,000.00 NOTE: DAYS BID, COST PER DAY, AND TIME TOTAL ARE ONLY REPORTED ON COST + TIME PROJECTS Description: CONSTRUCTION ON STATE HIGHWAY IN EL DORADO, PLACER, AND SACRAMENTO COUNTIES AT VARIOUS LOCATIONS In District 03 On Route 50, 80, 99 CallOrder: 1 Project ID: 0322000256 Amendments: 1 Bid Error Flag: No Bid Errors: Bid Modification Checksum: 05FA743174 Bid Creation Checksum: SOJUgcJq80g88mzG08cJWG3EGViOP5WqS9cj1uVgZhQ= Bid Security: Bidder's Bond License #: 1003811 California Company, Small Business and Non-Small Business preferences are not applied on Federally funded projects Small Business Preference: Non-Small Business Preference:

Bid Download Report By Bid Amount

Proposal: 07-0W4004 Call order: 1 Number of bids received: 7

Bidder ID	Vendor Name
VC0000021062	Security Paving Company Inc
VC000007931	Peterson-Chase General Engineering Construction, Inc.
VC230000057	RE Chaffee Construction Inc.
VC1800002280	Myers & Sons Construction, LLC
VC0000017387	FBD Vanguard Construction, Inc.
VC210000646	FEC Future Contractors and Engineers, Inc.
VC0000021515	C. A. Rasmussen, Inc.

Letting ID: 07-0W4004 Letting Date: 04/26/2023 Contract ID: 07-0W4004 Vendor Name: Security Paving Company Inc Cost total: \$2,689,151.50 Days bid: days @ \$ Cost Per Day Time total: \$0.00 Bid Amount (Cost+Time): \$2,689,151.50 NOTE: DAYS BID, COST PER DAY, AND TIME TOTAL ARE ONLY REPORTED ON COST + TIME PROJECTS Description: CONSTRUCTION ON STATE HIGHWAY IN VENTURA COUNTY IN AND NEAR VENTURA FROM VENTURA RIVER BRIDGE TO 0.4 MILE SOUTH OF PADRE JUAN CANYON ROAD OVERCROSSING AND FROM 0.4 MILE NORTH OF PUNTA GORDA PEDESTRIAN UNDERCROSSING TO BATES ROAD UNDERCROSSING. In District 07 On Route 101 CallOrder: 1 Project ID: 0722000046 Amendments: Bid Error Flag: No Bid Errors: Bid Modification Checksum: D3A19E2005 Bid Creation Checksum: uTpFVlTeN7ItyOZZd1lrR0n64UyWNA80QynGdaPLygs= Bid Security: Electronic Bidder's Bond License #: 116307 California Company, Small Business and Non-Small Business preferences are not applied on Federally funded projects Small Business Preference: Non-Small Business Preference: California Company Preference: not No

Letting ID: 07-0W4004 Letting Date: 04/26/2023 Contract ID: 07-0W4004 Vendor Name: Peterson-Chase General Engineering Construction, Inc. Cost total: \$2,691,245.00 Days bid: days @ \$ Cost Per Day Time total: \$0.00 Bid Amount (Cost+Time): \$2,691,245.00 NOTE: DAYS BID, COST PER DAY, AND TIME TOTAL ARE ONLY REPORTED ON COST + TIME PROJECTS Description: CONSTRUCTION ON STATE HIGHWAY IN VENTURA COUNTY IN AND NEAR VENTURA FROM VENTURA RIVER BRIDGE TO 0.4 MILE SOUTH OF PADRE JUAN CANYON ROAD OVERCROSSING AND FROM 0.4 MILE NORTH OF PUNTA GORDA PEDESTRIAN UNDERCROSSING TO BATES ROAD UNDERCROSSING. In District 07 On Route 101 CallOrder: 1 Project ID: 0722000046 Amendments: Bid Error Flag: No Bid Errors: Bid Modification Checksum: DD4E30E827 Bid Creation Checksum: uTpFVlTeN7ItyOZZd1lrR0n64UyWNA80QynGdaPLygs= Bid Security: Electronic Bidder's Bond License #: 615876 California Company, Small Business and Non-Small Business preferences are not applied on Federally funded projects Small Business Preference: Non-Small Business Preference:requests California Company Preference: not No

Letting ID: 07-0W4004 Letting Date: 04/26/2023 Contract ID: 07-0W4004 Vendor Name: RE Chaffee Construction Inc. Cost total: \$2,705,704.00 Days bid: days @ \$ Cost Per Day Time total: \$0.00 Bid Amount (Cost+Time): \$2,705,704.00 NOTE: DAYS BID, COST PER DAY, AND TIME TOTAL ARE ONLY REPORTED ON COST + TIME PROJECTS Description: CONSTRUCTION ON STATE HIGHWAY IN VENTURA COUNTY IN AND NEAR VENTURA FROM VENTURA RIVER BRIDGE TO 0.4 MILE SOUTH OF PADRE JUAN CANYON ROAD OVERCROSSING AND FROM 0.4 MILE NORTH OF PUNTA GORDA PEDESTRIAN UNDERCROSSING TO BATES ROAD UNDERCROSSING. In District 07 On Route 101 CallOrder: 1 Project ID: 0722000046 Amendments: Bid Error Flag: No Bid Errors: Bid Modification Checksum: E1A036F870 Bid Creation Checksum: uTpFVlTeN7ItyOZZd1lrR0n64UyWNA80QynGdaPLygs= Bid Security: Electronic Bidder's Bond License #: 897948 California Company, Small Business and Non-Small Business preferences are not applied on Federally funded projects Small Business Preference:requests Non-Small Business Preference: California Company Preference: not No

Letting ID: 07-0W4004 Letting Date: 04/26/2023 Contract ID: 07-0W4004 Vendor Name: Myers & Sons Construction, LLC Cost total: \$2,981,210.00 Days bid: days @ \$ Cost Per Day Time total: \$0.00 Bid Amount (Cost+Time): \$2,981,210.00 NOTE: DAYS BID, COST PER DAY, AND TIME TOTAL ARE ONLY REPORTED ON COST + TIME PROJECTS Description: CONSTRUCTION ON STATE HIGHWAY IN VENTURA COUNTY IN AND NEAR VENTURA FROM VENTURA RIVER BRIDGE TO 0.4 MILE SOUTH OF PADRE JUAN CANYON ROAD OVERCROSSING AND FROM 0.4 MILE NORTH OF PUNTA GORDA PEDESTRIAN UNDERCROSSING TO BATES ROAD UNDERCROSSING. In District 07 On Route 101 CallOrder: 1 Project ID: 0722000046 Amendments: Bid Error Flag: No Bid Errors: Bid Modification Checksum: 11825ACC15 Bid Creation Checksum: uTpFVlTeN7ItyOZZd1lrR0n64UyWNA80QynGdaPLygs= Bid Security: Electronic Bidder's Bond License #: 1033752 California Company, Small Business and Non-Small Business preferences are not applied on Federally funded projects Small Business Preference: Non-Small Business Preference: California Company Preference: not No

Letting ID: 07-0W4004 Letting Date: 04/26/2023 Contract ID: 07-0W4004 Vendor Name: FBD Vanguard Construction, Inc. Cost total: \$3,054,132.00 Days bid: days @ \$ Cost Per Day Time total: \$0.00 Bid Amount (Cost+Time): \$3,054,132.00 NOTE: DAYS BID, COST PER DAY, AND TIME TOTAL ARE ONLY REPORTED ON COST + TIME PROJECTS Description: CONSTRUCTION ON STATE HIGHWAY IN VENTURA COUNTY IN AND NEAR VENTURA FROM VENTURA RIVER BRIDGE TO 0.4 MILE SOUTH OF PADRE JUAN CANYON ROAD OVERCROSSING AND FROM 0.4 MILE NORTH OF PUNTA GORDA PEDESTRIAN UNDERCROSSING TO BATES ROAD UNDERCROSSING. In District 07 On Route 101 CallOrder: 1 Project ID: 0722000046 Amendments: Bid Error Flag: No Bid Errors: Bid Modification Checksum: C982E8B882 Bid Creation Checksum: uTpFVlTeN7ItyOZZd1lrR0n64UyWNA80QynGdaPLygs= Bid Security: Electronic Bidder's Bond License #: 833032 California Company, Small Business and Non-Small Business preferences are not applied on Federally funded projects Small Business Preference: Non-Small Business Preference: California Company Preference: not No

Letting ID: 07-0W4004 Letting Date: 04/26/2023 Contract ID: 07-0W4004 Vendor Name: FEC Future Contractors and Engineers, Inc. Cost total: \$3,296,403.00 Days bid: days @ \$ Cost Per Day Time total: \$0.00 Bid Amount (Cost+Time): \$3,296,403.00 NOTE: DAYS BID, COST PER DAY, AND TIME TOTAL ARE ONLY REPORTED ON COST + TIME PROJECTS Description: CONSTRUCTION ON STATE HIGHWAY IN VENTURA COUNTY IN AND NEAR VENTURA FROM VENTURA RIVER BRIDGE TO 0.4 MILE SOUTH OF PADRE JUAN CANYON ROAD OVERCROSSING AND FROM 0.4 MILE NORTH OF PUNTA GORDA PEDESTRIAN UNDERCROSSING TO BATES ROAD UNDERCROSSING. In District 07 On Route 101 CallOrder: 1 Project ID: 0722000046 Amendments: Bid Error Flag: No Bid Errors: Bid Modification Checksum: B0A4D967A6 Bid Creation Checksum: uTpFVlTeN7ItyOZZd1lrR0n64UyWNA80QynGdaPLygs= Bid Security: Electronic Bidder's Bond License #: 959988 California Company, Small Business and Non-Small Business preferences are not applied on Federally funded projects Small Business Preference:requests Non-Small Business Preference: California Company Preference: not No

Letting ID: 07-0W4004 Letting Date: 04/26/2023 Contract ID: 07-0W4004 Vendor Name: C. A. Rasmussen, Inc. Cost total: \$3,445,498.50 Days bid: days @ \$ Cost Per Day Time total: \$0.00 Bid Amount (Cost+Time): \$3,445,498.50 NOTE: DAYS BID, COST PER DAY, AND TIME TOTAL ARE ONLY REPORTED ON COST + TIME PROJECTS Description: CONSTRUCTION ON STATE HIGHWAY IN VENTURA COUNTY IN AND NEAR VENTURA FROM VENTURA RIVER BRIDGE TO 0.4 MILE SOUTH OF PADRE JUAN CANYON ROAD OVERCROSSING AND FROM 0.4 MILE NORTH OF PUNTA GORDA PEDESTRIAN UNDERCROSSING TO BATES ROAD UNDERCROSSING. In District 07 On Route 101 CallOrder: 1 Project ID: 0722000046 Amendments: Bid Error Flag: No Bid Errors: Bid Modification Checksum: 6A14EF04C7 Bid Creation Checksum: uTpFVlTeN7ItyOZZd1lrR0n64UyWNA80QynGdaPLygs= Bid Security: Electronic Bidder's Bond License #: 254681 California Company, Small Business and Non-Small Business preferences are not applied on Federally funded projects Small Business Preference: Non-Small Business Preference: California Company Preference: not No

Bid Download Report By Bid Amount

Proposal: 08-1M4904 Call order: 1 Number of bids received: 5

Bidder ID	Vendor Name
VC0000015162	Velarde Concrete Construction, Inc.
VC000007931	Peterson-Chase General Engineering Construction, Inc.
VC1800002280	Myers & Sons Construction, LLC
VC1700004388	American Civil Constructors West Coast LLC
VC0000017316	Truesdell Corporation of California, Inc.

Letting ID: 08-1M4904 Letting Date: 04/26/2023 Contract ID: 08-1M4904 Vendor Name: Velarde Concrete Construction, Inc. Cost total: \$2,826,987.36 Days bid: days @ \$ Cost Per Day Time total: \$0.00 Bid Amount (Cost+Time): \$2,826,987.36 NOTE: DAYS BID, COST PER DAY, AND TIME TOTAL ARE ONLY REPORTED ON COST + TIME PROJECTS Description: CONSTRUCTION ON STATE HIGHWAY IN SAN BERNARDINO COUNTY AT VARIOUS LOCATIONS FROM 0.3 MILE WEST OF ARCHIBALD AVENUE OVERCROSSING TO RIVERSIDE AVENUE OVERCROSSING In District 08 On Route 10 CallOrder: 1 Project ID: 0821000129 Amendments: Bid Error Flag: No Bid Errors: Bid Modification Checksum: E7C374727D Bid Creation Checksum: 2k1tyvCFXwgTtn87RFf7mdw6FFSfvCrzMjicAS0reG4= Bid Security: Electronic Bidder's Bond License #: 662355 California Company, Small Business and Non-Small Business preferences are not applied on Federally funded projects Small Business Preference:requests Non-Small Business Preference: California Company Preference: not No

Letting ID: 08-1M4904 Letting Date: 04/26/2023 Contract ID: 08-1M4904 Vendor Name: Peterson-Chase General Engineering Construction, Inc. Cost total: \$3,483,413.40 Days bid: days @ \$ Cost Per Day Time total: \$0.00 Bid Amount (Cost+Time): \$3,483,413.40 NOTE: DAYS BID, COST PER DAY, AND TIME TOTAL ARE ONLY REPORTED ON COST + TIME PROJECTS Description: CONSTRUCTION ON STATE HIGHWAY IN SAN BERNARDINO COUNTY AT VARIOUS LOCATIONS FROM 0.3 MILE WEST OF ARCHIBALD AVENUE OVERCROSSING TO RIVERSIDE AVENUE OVERCROSSING In District 08 On Route 10 CallOrder: 1 Project ID: 0821000129 Amendments: Bid Error Flag: No Bid Errors: Bid Modification Checksum: 5D4DFED5FC Bid Creation Checksum: 2k1tyvCFXwgTtn87RFf7mdw6FFSfvCrzMjicAS0reG4= Bid Security: Electronic Bidder's Bond License #: 615876 California Company, Small Business and Non-Small Business preferences are not applied on Federally funded projects Small Business Preference: Non-Small Business Preference:requests California Company Preference: not No

Letting ID: 08-1M4904 Letting Date: 04/26/2023 Contract ID: 08-1M4904 Vendor Name: Myers & Sons Construction, LLC Cost total: \$3,631,330.50 Days bid: days @ \$ Cost Per Day Time total: \$0.00 Bid Amount (Cost+Time): \$3,631,330.50 NOTE: DAYS BID, COST PER DAY, AND TIME TOTAL ARE ONLY REPORTED ON COST + TIME PROJECTS Description: CONSTRUCTION ON STATE HIGHWAY IN SAN BERNARDINO COUNTY AT VARIOUS LOCATIONS FROM 0.3 MILE WEST OF ARCHIBALD AVENUE OVERCROSSING TO RIVERSIDE AVENUE OVERCROSSING In District 08 On Route 10 CallOrder: 1 Project ID: 0821000129 Amendments: Bid Error Flag: No Bid Errors: Bid Modification Checksum: 258DA86550 Bid Creation Checksum: 2k1tyvCFXwgTtn87RFf7mdw6FFSfvCrzMjicAS0reG4= Bid Security: Bidder's Bond License #: 1033752 California Company, Small Business and Non-Small Business preferences are not applied on Federally funded projects Small Business Preference: Non-Small Business Preference: California Company Preference: not No

Letting ID: 08-1M4904 Letting Date: 04/26/2023 Contract ID: 08-1M4904 Vendor Name: American Civil Constructors West Coast LLC Cost total: \$3,725,000.00 Days bid: days @ \$ Cost Per Day Time total: \$0.00 Bid Amount (Cost+Time): \$3,725,000.00 NOTE: DAYS BID, COST PER DAY, AND TIME TOTAL ARE ONLY REPORTED ON COST + TIME PROJECTS Description: CONSTRUCTION ON STATE HIGHWAY IN SAN BERNARDINO COUNTY AT VARIOUS LOCATIONS FROM 0.3 MILE WEST OF ARCHIBALD AVENUE OVERCROSSING TO RIVERSIDE AVENUE OVERCROSSING In District 08 On Route 10 CallOrder: 1 Project ID: 0821000129 Amendments: Bid Error Flag: No Bid Errors: Bid Modification Checksum: 01F9399DD7 Bid Creation Checksum: 2k1tyvCFXwgTtn87RFf7mdw6FFSfvCrzMjicAS0reG4= Bid Security: Electronic Bidder's Bond License #: 1011546 California Company, Small Business and Non-Small Business preferences are not applied on Federally funded projects Small Business Preference: Non-Small Business Preference: California Company Preference: not No

Letting ID: 08-1M4904 Letting Date: 04/26/2023 Contract ID: 08-1M4904 Vendor Name: Truesdell Corporation of California, Inc. Cost total: \$3,969,969.00 Days bid: days @ \$ Cost Per Day Time total: \$0.00 Bid Amount (Cost+Time): \$3,969,969.00 NOTE: DAYS BID, COST PER DAY, AND TIME TOTAL ARE ONLY REPORTED ON COST + TIME PROJECTS Description: CONSTRUCTION ON STATE HIGHWAY IN SAN BERNARDINO COUNTY AT VARIOUS LOCATIONS FROM 0.3 MILE WEST OF ARCHIBALD AVENUE OVERCROSSING TO RIVERSIDE AVENUE OVERCROSSING In District 08 On Route 10 CallOrder: 1 Project ID: 0821000129 Amendments: Bid Error Flag: No Bid Errors: Bid Modification Checksum: 2A02A67180 Bid Creation Checksum: 2k1tyvCFXwgTtn87RFf7mdw6FFSfvCrzMjicAS0reG4= Bid Security: Bidder's Bond License #: 615058 California Company, Small Business and Non-Small Business preferences are not applied on Federally funded projects Small Business Preference: Non-Small Business Preference: California Company Preference: not No

Bid Download Report By Bid Amount

Proposal: 11-2N1664 Call order: 1 Number of bids received: 4

Bidder ID	Vendor Name
VC1500000675	Martin Marietta San Diego Aggregates LLC dba ATP General Engineering Contractors
VC1800004250	Hazard Construction Engr, LLC
VC1300004198	Calmex Engineering, INC.
VC000000213	Granite Construction Company

Letting ID: 11-2N1664 Letting Date: 04/26/2023 Contract ID: 11-2N1664 Vendor Name: Martin Marietta San Diego Aggregates LLC dba ATP General Engineering Contractors Cost total: \$2,886,641.00 Days bid: days @ \$ Cost Per Day Time total: \$0.00 Bid Amount (Cost+Time): \$2,886,641.00 NOTE: DAYS BID, COST PER DAY, AND TIME TOTAL ARE ONLY REPORTED ON COST + TIME PROJECTS Description: CONSTRUCTION ON STATE HIGHWAY IN SAN DIEGO COUNTY NEAR SUNSHINE SUMMIT FROM 1.2 MILES NORTH OF ACORN CREEK BRIDGE TO RIVERSIDE COUNTY LINE In District 11 On Route 79 CallOrder: 1 Project ID: 1122000153 Amendments: Bid Error Flag: No Bid Errors: Bid Modification Checksum: FAEE341B6B Bid Creation Checksum: WYWcfJ1VaWRJqQjSrnCXH6YHFhskX4iUVnCkwBlE18A= Bid Security: Electronic Bidder's Bond License #: 502506 California Company, Small Business and Non-Small Business preferences are not applied on Federally funded projects Small Business Preference: Non-Small Business Preference: California Company Preference: not No

Letting ID: 11-2N1664 Letting Date: 04/26/2023 Contract ID: 11-2N1664 Vendor Name: Hazard Construction Engr, LLC Cost total: \$3,163,598.00 Days bid: days @ \$ Cost Per Day Time total: \$0.00 Bid Amount (Cost+Time): \$3,163,598.00 NOTE: DAYS BID, COST PER DAY, AND TIME TOTAL ARE ONLY REPORTED ON COST + TIME PROJECTS Description: CONSTRUCTION ON STATE HIGHWAY IN SAN DIEGO COUNTY NEAR SUNSHINE SUMMIT FROM 1.2 MILES NORTH OF ACORN CREEK BRIDGE TO RIVERSIDE COUNTY LINE In District 11 On Route 79 CallOrder: 1 Project ID: 1122000153 Amendments: Bid Error Flag: No Bid Errors: Bid Modification Checksum: 2FD78726C7 Bid Creation Checksum: WYWcfJ1VaWRJqQjSrnCXH6YHFhskX4iUVnCkwBlE18A= Bid Security: Electronic Bidder's Bond License #: 1038899 California Company, Small Business and Non-Small Business preferences are not applied on Federally funded projects

Small Business Preference: Non-Small Business Preference: California Company Preference: not No

Letting ID: 11-2N1664 Letting Date: 04/26/2023 Contract ID: 11-2N1664 Vendor Name: Calmex Engineering, INC. Cost total: \$3,421,349.00 Days bid: days @ \$ Cost Per Day Time total: \$0.00 Bid Amount (Cost+Time): \$3,421,349.00 NOTE: DAYS BID, COST PER DAY, AND TIME TOTAL ARE ONLY REPORTED ON COST + TIME PROJECTS Description: CONSTRUCTION ON STATE HIGHWAY IN SAN DIEGO COUNTY NEAR SUNSHINE SUMMIT FROM 1.2 MILES NORTH OF ACORN CREEK BRIDGE TO RIVERSIDE COUNTY LINE In District 11 On Route 79 CallOrder: 1 Project ID: 1122000153 Amendments: Bid Error Flag: No Bid Errors: Bid Modification Checksum: 3A8EE40848 Bid Creation Checksum: WYWcfJ1VaWRJqQjSrnCXH6YHFhskX4iUVnCkwBlE18A= Bid Security: Electronic Bidder's Bond License #: 685954 California Company, Small Business and Non-Small Business preferences are not applied on Federally funded projects Small Business Preference:requests

Non-Small Business Preference: California Company Preference: not No

Letting ID: 11-2N1664 Letting Date: 04/26/2023 Contract ID: 11-2N1664 Vendor Name: Granite Construction Company Cost total: \$3,849,940.00 Days bid: days @ \$ Cost Per Day Time total: \$0.00 Bid Amount (Cost+Time): \$3,849,940.00 NOTE: DAYS BID, COST PER DAY, AND TIME TOTAL ARE ONLY REPORTED ON COST + TIME PROJECTS Description: CONSTRUCTION ON STATE HIGHWAY IN SAN DIEGO COUNTY NEAR SUNSHINE SUMMIT FROM 1.2 MILES NORTH OF ACORN CREEK BRIDGE TO RIVERSIDE COUNTY LINE In District 11 On Route 79 CallOrder: 1 Project ID: 1122000153 Amendments: Bid Error Flag: No Bid Errors: Bid Modification Checksum: 215E7F9CB5 Bid Creation Checksum: WYWcfJ1VaWRJqQjSrnCXH6YHFhskX4iUVnCkwBlE18A= Bid Security: Electronic Bidder's Bond License #: 89 California Company, Small Business and Non-Small Business preferences are not applied on Federally funded projects

Small Business Preference: Non-Small Business Preference: California Company Preference: not No

Bid Download Report By Bid Amount

Proposal: 12-0S7804 Call order: 1 Number of bids received: 5

Bidder ID	Vendor Name
VC0000022161	Ortiz Enterprises, Inc.
VC000008313	HighLand Construction, Inc.
VC2200002094	POLO Engineering, Inc.
VC2100000646	FEC Future Contractors and Engineers, Inc.
VC0000021572	All American Asphalt

Letting ID: 12-0S7804 Letting Date: 04/26/2023 Contract ID: 12-0S7804 Vendor Name: Ortiz Enterprises, Inc. Cost total: \$739,370.00 Days bid: days @ \$ Cost Per Day Time total: \$0.00 Bid Amount (Cost+Time): \$739,370.00 NOTE: DAYS BID, COST PER DAY, AND TIME TOTAL ARE ONLY REPORTED ON COST + TIME PROJECTS Description: CONSTRUCTION ON STATE HIGHWAY IN ORANGE COUNTY IN LAGUNA NIGUEL FROM 0.3 MILE TO 0.1 MILE SOUTH OF CABOT ROAD UNDERCROSSING In District 12 On Route 73 CallOrder: 1 Project ID: 1221000044 Amendments: Bid Error Flag: No Bid Errors: Bid Modification Checksum: F4E18D0345 Bid Creation Checksum: 683olWEqXDMzYm0C3weawNqMd+ZqVJQvmw6eyDOTBtQ= Bid Security: Electronic Bidder's Bond License #: 467088 California Company, Small Business and Non-Small Business preferences are not applied on Federally funded projects Small Business Preference: Non-Small Business Preference:

Letting ID: 12-0S7804 Letting Date: 04/26/2023 Contract ID: 12-0S7804 Vendor Name: HighLand Construction, Inc. Cost total: \$991,735.00 Days bid: days @ \$ Cost Per Day Time total: \$0.00 Bid Amount (Cost+Time): \$991,735.00 NOTE: DAYS BID, COST PER DAY, AND TIME TOTAL ARE ONLY REPORTED ON COST + TIME PROJECTS Description: CONSTRUCTION ON STATE HIGHWAY IN ORANGE COUNTY IN LAGUNA NIGUEL FROM 0.3 MILE TO 0.1 MILE SOUTH OF CABOT ROAD UNDERCROSSING In District 12 On Route 73 CallOrder: 1 Project ID: 1221000044 Amendments: Bid Error Flag: No Bid Errors: Bid Modification Checksum: EE0190832A Bid Creation Checksum: 683olWEqXDMzYm0C3weawNqMd+ZqVJQvmw6eyDOTBtQ= Bid Security: Electronic Bidder's Bond License #: 743775 California Company, Small Business and Non-Small Business preferences are not applied on Federally funded projects Small Business Preference:requests Non-Small Business Preference:

Letting ID: 12-0S7804 Letting Date: 04/26/2023 Contract ID: 12-0S7804 Vendor Name: POLO Engineering, Inc. Cost total: \$1,198,197.00 Days bid: days @ \$ Cost Per Day Time total: \$0.00 Bid Amount (Cost+Time): \$1,198,197.00 NOTE: DAYS BID, COST PER DAY, AND TIME TOTAL ARE ONLY REPORTED ON COST + TIME PROJECTS Description: CONSTRUCTION ON STATE HIGHWAY IN ORANGE COUNTY IN LAGUNA NIGUEL FROM 0.3 MILE TO 0.1 MILE SOUTH OF CABOT ROAD UNDERCROSSING In District 12 On Route 73 CallOrder: 1 Project ID: 1221000044 Amendments: Bid Error Flag: No Bid Errors: Bid Modification Checksum: E74688C2AB Bid Creation Checksum: 683olWEqXDMzYm0C3weawNqMd+ZqVJQvmw6eyDOTBtQ= Bid Security: Electronic Bidder's Bond License #: 1051001 California Company, Small Business and Non-Small Business preferences are not applied on Federally funded projects Small Business Preference:requests Non-Small Business Preference:

Letting ID: 12-0S7804 Letting Date: 04/26/2023 Contract ID: 12-0S7804 Vendor Name: FEC Future Contractors and Engineers, Inc. Cost total: \$1,270,687.00 Days bid: days @ \$ Cost Per Day Time total: \$0.00 Bid Amount (Cost+Time): \$1,270,687.00 NOTE: DAYS BID, COST PER DAY, AND TIME TOTAL ARE ONLY REPORTED ON COST + TIME PROJECTS Description: CONSTRUCTION ON STATE HIGHWAY IN ORANGE COUNTY IN LAGUNA NIGUEL FROM 0.3 MILE TO 0.1 MILE SOUTH OF CABOT ROAD UNDERCROSSING In District 12 On Route 73 CallOrder: 1 Project ID: 1221000044 Amendments: Bid Error Flag: No Bid Errors: Bid Modification Checksum: 27F32533DD Bid Creation Checksum: 683olWEqXDMzYm0C3weawNqMd+ZqVJQvmw6eyDOTBtQ= Bid Security: Electronic Bidder's Bond License #: 959988 California Company, Small Business and Non-Small Business preferences are not applied on Federally funded projects Small Business Preference:requests Non-Small Business Preference:

Letting ID: 12-0S7804 Letting Date: 04/26/2023 Contract ID: 12-0S7804 Vendor Name: All American Asphalt Cost total: \$1,422,477.00 Days bid: days @ \$ Cost Per Day Time total: \$0.00 Bid Amount (Cost+Time): \$1,422,477.00 NOTE: DAYS BID, COST PER DAY, AND TIME TOTAL ARE ONLY REPORTED ON COST + TIME PROJECTS Description: CONSTRUCTION ON STATE HIGHWAY IN ORANGE COUNTY IN LAGUNA NIGUEL FROM 0.3 MILE TO 0.1 MILE SOUTH OF CABOT ROAD UNDERCROSSING In District 12 On Route 73 CallOrder: 1 Project ID: 1221000044 Amendments: Bid Error Flag: No Bid Errors: Bid Modification Checksum: B5B968091E Bid Creation Checksum: 683olWEqXDMzYm0C3weawNqMd+ZqVJQvmw6eyDOTBtQ= Bid Security: Electronic Bidder's Bond License #: 267073 California Company, Small Business and Non-Small Business preferences are not applied on Federally funded projects Small Business Preference:

Non-Small Business Preference: California Company Preference: not No