Bid Download Report By Bid Amount

Proposal: 01-0L4604 Call order: 1 Number of bids received: 2

Bidder ID	Vendor Name
VC2000002246	St. Francis Electric, LLC
VC1700002193	Lee Contractors

Letting ID: 01-0L4604 Letting Date: 06/20/2023 Contract ID: 01-0L4604 Vendor Name: St. Francis Electric, LLC Cost total: \$637,500.00 Days bid: days @ \$ Cost Per Day Time total: \$0.00 Bid Amount (Cost+Time): \$637,500.00 NOTE: DAYS BID, COST PER DAY, AND TIME TOTAL ARE ONLY REPORTED ON COST + TIME PROJECTS Description: CONSTRUCTION ON STATE HIGHWAY IN DEL NORTE AND MENDOCINO COUNTIES AT VARIOUS LOCATIONS In District 01 On Route 20, 101 CallOrder: 1 Project ID: 0122000013 Amendments: 1 Bid Error Flag: No Bid Errors: Bid Modification Checksum: 2DD519E41E Bid Creation Checksum: YqVGMq53D7OypUYb3EAwR4QK5vPLZMHPwDcja30rw5Y= Bid Security: Bidder's Bond License #: 1003811 California Company, Small Business and Non-Small Business preferences are not applied on Federally funded projects Small Business Preference: Non-Small Business Preference: California Company Preference: not No

Letting ID: 01-0L4604 Letting Date: 06/20/2023 Contract ID: 01-0L4604 Vendor Name: Lee Contractors Cost total: \$747,584.00 Days bid: days @ \$ Cost Per Day Time total: \$0.00 Bid Amount (Cost+Time): \$747,584.00 NOTE: DAYS BID, COST PER DAY, AND TIME TOTAL ARE ONLY REPORTED ON COST + TIME PROJECTS Description: CONSTRUCTION ON STATE HIGHWAY IN DEL NORTE AND MENDOCINO COUNTIES AT VARIOUS LOCATIONS In District 01 On Route 20, 101 CallOrder: 1 Project ID: 0122000013 Amendments: 1 Bid Error Flag: No Bid Errors: Bid Modification Checksum: 6DCAF9DF2D Bid Creation Checksum: YqVGMq53D7OypUYb3EAwR4QK5vPLZMHPwDcja30rw5Y= Bid Security: Electronic Bidder's Bond License #: 961702 California Company, Small Business and Non-Small Business preferences are not applied on Federally funded projects Small Business Preference: Non-Small Business Preference:

California Company Preference: not No

Bid Download Report By Bid Amount

Proposal: 06-1A6904 Call order: 1 Number of bids received: 3

Bidder ID	Vendor Name
VC0000017263	Coral Construction Company
VC0000013893	Midstate Barrier, Inc.
VC000006136	Danny C. Hubbs Construction, Inc.

Letting ID: 06-1A6904 Letting Date: 06/20/2023 Contract ID: 06-1A6904 Vendor Name: Coral Construction Company Cost total: \$1,357,777.00 Days bid: days @ \$ Cost Per Day Time total: \$0.00 Bid Amount (Cost+Time): \$1,357,777.00 NOTE: DAYS BID, COST PER DAY, AND TIME TOTAL ARE ONLY REPORTED ON COST + TIME PROJECTS Description: CONSTRUCTION ON STATE HIGHWAY IN KERN COUNTY NEAR BUTTONWILLOW FROM 2.1 MILES NORTH OF STOCKDALE HIGHWAY OVERCROSSING TO ROUTE 5/58 SEPARATION In District 06 On Route 5 CallOrder: 1 Project ID: 0620000116 Amendments: Bid Error Flag: No Bid Errors: Bid Modification Checksum: F3EFA68136 Bid Creation Checksum: FcxVJHSkPhT3/KsijvVEQPycNYZJ6HIA2NFnN2GUwl4= Bid Security: Bidder's Bond License #: 332441 California Company, Small Business and Non-Small Business preferences are not applied on Federally funded projects Small Business Preference:

Non-Small Business Preference: California Company Preference: not No

Letting ID: 06-1A6904 Letting Date: 06/20/2023 Contract ID: 06-1A6904 Vendor Name: Midstate Barrier, Inc. Cost total: \$1,677,735.00 Days bid: days @ \$ Cost Per Day Time total: \$0.00 Bid Amount (Cost+Time): \$1,677,735.00 NOTE: DAYS BID, COST PER DAY, AND TIME TOTAL ARE ONLY REPORTED ON COST + TIME PROJECTS Description: CONSTRUCTION ON STATE HIGHWAY IN KERN COUNTY NEAR BUTTONWILLOW FROM 2.1 MILES NORTH OF STOCKDALE HIGHWAY OVERCROSSING TO ROUTE 5/58 SEPARATION In District 06 On Route 5 CallOrder: 1 Project ID: 0620000116 Amendments: Bid Error Flag: No Bid Errors: Bid Modification Checksum: 006B747B57 Bid Creation Checksum: FcxVJHSkPhT3/KsijvVEQPycNYZJ6HIA2NFnN2GUwl4= Bid Security: Electronic Bidder's Bond License #: 529261 California Company, Small Business and Non-Small Business preferences are not applied on Federally funded projects

Small Business Preference: Non-Small Business Preference: California Company Preference: not No

Letting ID: 06-1A6904 Letting Date: 06/20/2023 Contract ID: 06-1A6904 Vendor Name: Danny C. Hubbs Construction, Inc. Cost total: \$1,733,498.00 Days bid: days @ \$ Cost Per Day Time total: \$0.00 Bid Amount (Cost+Time): \$1,733,498.00 NOTE: DAYS BID, COST PER DAY, AND TIME TOTAL ARE ONLY REPORTED ON COST + TIME PROJECTS Description: CONSTRUCTION ON STATE HIGHWAY IN KERN COUNTY NEAR BUTTONWILLOW FROM 2.1 MILES NORTH OF STOCKDALE HIGHWAY OVERCROSSING TO ROUTE 5/58 SEPARATION In District 06 On Route 5 CallOrder: 1 Project ID: 0620000116 Amendments: Bid Error Flag: No Bid Errors: Bid Modification Checksum: 3C8F1BC944 Bid Creation Checksum: FcxVJHSkPhT3/KsijvVEQPycNYZJ6HIA2NFnN2GUwl4= Bid Security: Electronic Bidder's Bond License #: 509249 California Company, Small Business and Non-Small Business preferences are not applied on Federally funded projects

Small Business Preference: Non-Small Business Preference: California Company Preference: not No

Bid Download Report By Bid Amount

Proposal: 06-1E6604 Call order: 1 Number of bids received: 4

Bidder ID	Vendor Name
VC1300003023	CAL VALLEY CONSTRUCTION, INC.
VC0000013007	Clean Cut Landscape Inc
VC2200003323	DOJA INC.
VC000000213	Granite Construction Company

Letting ID: 06-1E6604 Letting Date: 06/20/2023 Contract ID: 06-1E6604 Vendor Name: CAL VALLEY CONSTRUCTION, INC. Cost total: \$439,593.00 Days bid: days @ \$ Cost Per Day Time total: \$0.00 Bid Amount (Cost+Time): \$439,593.00 NOTE: DAYS BID, COST PER DAY, AND TIME TOTAL ARE ONLY REPORTED ON COST + TIME PROJECTS Description: CONSTRUCTION ON STATE HIGHWAY IN FRESNO COUNTY NEAR KERMAN AT JENSEN AVENUE In District 06 On Route 145 CallOrder: 1 Project ID: 0622000079 Amendments: Bid Error Flag: No Bid Errors: Bid Modification Checksum: 7E7E9421EF Bid Creation Checksum: mj0Rp5Ep70i4BZjZvL+fFPJ9xD0LDF4tzONHGo2bJHQ= Bid Security: Electronic Bidder's Bond License #: 873800 California Company, Small Business and Non-Small Business preferences are not applied on Federally funded projects Small Business Preference: Non-Small Business Preference:requests California Company Preference: not No

Letting ID: 06-1E6604 Letting Date: 06/20/2023 Contract ID: 06-1E6604 Vendor Name: Clean Cut Landscape Inc Cost total: \$442,447.00 Days bid: days @ \$ Cost Per Day Time total: \$0.00 Bid Amount (Cost+Time): \$442,447.00 NOTE: DAYS BID, COST PER DAY, AND TIME TOTAL ARE ONLY REPORTED ON COST + TIME PROJECTS Description: CONSTRUCTION ON STATE HIGHWAY IN FRESNO COUNTY NEAR KERMAN AT JENSEN AVENUE In District 06 On Route 145 CallOrder: 1 Project ID: 0622000079 Amendments: Bid Error Flag: No Bid Errors: Bid Modification Checksum: 3F6B3F4BB5 Bid Creation Checksum: mj0Rp5Ep70i4BZjZvL+fFPJ9xD0LDF4tzONHGo2bJHQ= Bid Security: Electronic Bidder's Bond License #: 722882 California Company, Small Business and Non-Small Business preferences are not applied on Federally funded projects Small Business Preference:requests Non-Small Business Preference: California Company Preference: not No

Letting ID: 06-1E6604 Letting Date: 06/20/2023 Contract ID: 06-1E6604 Vendor Name: DOJA INC. Cost total: \$496,000.00 Days bid: days @ \$ Cost Per Day Time total: \$0.00 Bid Amount (Cost+Time): \$496,000.00 NOTE: DAYS BID, COST PER DAY, AND TIME TOTAL ARE ONLY REPORTED ON COST + TIME PROJECTS Description: CONSTRUCTION ON STATE HIGHWAY IN FRESNO COUNTY NEAR KERMAN AT JENSEN AVENUE In District 06 On Route 145 CallOrder: 1 Project ID: 0622000079 Amendments: Bid Error Flag: No Bid Errors: Bid Modification Checksum: B0B03ED66D Bid Creation Checksum: mj0Rp5Ep70i4BZjZvL+fFPJ9xD0LDF4tzONHGo2bJHQ= Bid Security: Electronic Bidder's Bond License #: 597764 California Company, Small Business and Non-Small Business preferences are not applied on Federally funded projects Small Business Preference: Non-Small Business Preference: California Company Preference: not No

Letting ID: 06-1E6604 Letting Date: 06/20/2023 Contract ID: 06-1E6604 Vendor Name: Granite Construction Company Cost total: \$540,525.00 Days bid: days @ \$ Cost Per Day Time total: \$0.00 Bid Amount (Cost+Time): \$540,525.00 NOTE: DAYS BID, COST PER DAY, AND TIME TOTAL ARE ONLY REPORTED ON COST + TIME PROJECTS Description: CONSTRUCTION ON STATE HIGHWAY IN FRESNO COUNTY NEAR KERMAN AT JENSEN AVENUE In District 06 On Route 145 CallOrder: 1 Project ID: 0622000079 Amendments: Bid Error Flag: No Bid Errors: Bid Modification Checksum: F958D4B4CB Bid Creation Checksum: mj0Rp5Ep70i4BZjZvL+fFPJ9xD0LDF4tzONHGo2bJHQ= Bid Security: Electronic Bidder's Bond License #: 89 California Company, Small Business and Non-Small Business preferences are not applied on Federally funded projects Small Business Preference:

Non-Small Business Preference: California Company Preference: not No