Bid Download Report By Bid Amount

Proposal: 01-0E11U4 Call order: 1 Number of bids received: 6

Bidder ID	Vendor Name
VC2000002837	Steelhead Constructors JV
VC1400003011	MCCULLOUGH CONSTRUCTION INC
VC000000213	Granite Construction Company
VC000009886	Golden State Bridge, Inc.
VC1800002280	Myers & Sons Construction, LLC
VC0000014187	Ghilotti Construction Co.

Letting ID: 01-0E11U4 0720 Letting Date: 07/20/2023 Contract ID: 01-0E11U4 Vendor Name: Steelhead Constructors JV Cost total: \$10,888,888.00 Days bid: 175 days @ \$10000.00 Cost Per Day Time total: \$1,750,000.00 Bid Amount (Cost+Time): \$12,638,888.00 NOTE: DAYS BID, COST PER DAY, AND TIME TOTAL ARE ONLY REPORTED ON COST + TIME PROJECTS Description: CONSTRUCTION ON STATE HIGHWAY IN MENDOCINO COUNTY NEAR ELK FROM 0.2 MILE SOUTH OF ELK CREEK BRIDGE TO 0.2 MILE NORTH OF ELK CREEK BRIDGE In District 01 On Route 1 CallOrder: 1 Project ID: 0123000069 Amendments: 3 Bid Error Flag: No Bid Errors: Bid Modification Checksum: 4696B0F323 Bid Creation Checksum: HjzTdymw2dlYa0prJNHCENp3dBsk7x5rznOEURpXcuY= Bid Security: Electronic Bidder's Bond License #: 1064122 California Company, Small Business and Non-Small Business preferences are not applied on Federally funded projects

Letting ID: 01-0E11U4 0720 Letting Date: 07/20/2023 Contract ID: 01-0E11U4 Vendor Name: MCCULLOUGH CONSTRUCTION INC Cost total: \$11,783,344.40 Days bid: 175 days @ \$10000.00 Cost Per Day Time total: \$1,750,000.00 Bid Amount (Cost+Time): \$13,533,344.40 NOTE: DAYS BID, COST PER DAY, AND TIME TOTAL ARE ONLY REPORTED ON COST + TIME PROJECTS Description: CONSTRUCTION ON STATE HIGHWAY IN MENDOCINO COUNTY NEAR ELK FROM 0.2 MILE SOUTH OF ELK CREEK BRIDGE TO 0.2 MILE NORTH OF ELK CREEK BRIDGE In District 01 On Route 1 CallOrder: 1 Project ID: 0123000069 Amendments: 3 Bid Error Flag: No Bid Errors: Bid Modification Checksum: 3A50B684BE Bid Creation Checksum: HjzTdymw2dlYa0prJNHCENp3dBsk7x5rznOEURpXcuY= Bid Security: Electronic Bidder's Bond License #: 715577 California Company, Small Business and Non-Small Business preferences are not applied on Federally funded projects

Letting ID: 01-0E11U4 0720 Letting Date: 07/20/2023 Contract ID: 01-0E11U4 Vendor Name: Granite Construction Company Cost total: \$11,983,837.38 Days bid: 175 days @ \$10000.00 Cost Per Day Time total: \$1,750,000.00 Bid Amount (Cost+Time): \$13,733,837.38 NOTE: DAYS BID, COST PER DAY, AND TIME TOTAL ARE ONLY REPORTED ON COST + TIME PROJECTS Description: CONSTRUCTION ON STATE HIGHWAY IN MENDOCINO COUNTY NEAR ELK FROM 0.2 MILE SOUTH OF ELK CREEK BRIDGE TO 0.2 MILE NORTH OF ELK CREEK BRIDGE In District 01 On Route 1 CallOrder: 1 Project ID: 0123000069 Amendments: 3 Bid Error Flag: No Bid Errors: Bid Modification Checksum: C64AE7472E Bid Creation Checksum: HjzTdymw2dlYa0prJNHCENp3dBsk7x5rznOEURpXcuY= Bid Security: Electronic Bidder's Bond License #: 89 California Company, Small Business and Non-Small Business preferences are not applied on Federally funded projects

Letting ID: 01-0E11U4 0720 Letting Date: 07/20/2023 Contract ID: 01-0E11U4 Vendor Name: Golden State Bridge, Inc. Cost total: \$13,680,289.66 Days bid: 175 days @ \$10000.00 Cost Per Day Time total: \$1,750,000.00 Bid Amount (Cost+Time): \$15,430,289.66 NOTE: DAYS BID, COST PER DAY, AND TIME TOTAL ARE ONLY REPORTED ON COST + TIME PROJECTS Description: CONSTRUCTION ON STATE HIGHWAY IN MENDOCINO COUNTY NEAR ELK FROM 0.2 MILE SOUTH OF ELK CREEK BRIDGE TO 0.2 MILE NORTH OF ELK CREEK BRIDGE In District 01 On Route 1 CallOrder: 1 Project ID: 0123000069 Amendments: 3 Bid Error Flag: No Bid Errors: Bid Modification Checksum: 0D8683CD2E Bid Creation Checksum: HjzTdymw2dlYa0prJNHCENp3dBsk7x5rznOEURpXcuY= Bid Security: Electronic Bidder's Bond License #: 851187 California Company, Small Business and Non-Small Business preferences are not applied on Federally funded projects

Letting ID: 01-0E11U4 0720 Letting Date: 07/20/2023 Contract ID: 01-0E11U4 Vendor Name: Myers & Sons Construction, LLC Cost total: \$15,198,688.00 Days bid: 175 days @ \$10000.00 Cost Per Day Time total: \$1,750,000.00 Bid Amount (Cost+Time): \$16,948,688.00 NOTE: DAYS BID, COST PER DAY, AND TIME TOTAL ARE ONLY REPORTED ON COST + TIME PROJECTS Description: CONSTRUCTION ON STATE HIGHWAY IN MENDOCINO COUNTY NEAR ELK FROM 0.2 MILE SOUTH OF ELK CREEK BRIDGE TO 0.2 MILE NORTH OF ELK CREEK BRIDGE In District 01 On Route 1 CallOrder: 1 Project ID: 0123000069 Amendments: 3 Bid Error Flag: No Bid Errors: Bid Modification Checksum: 469844E0ED Bid Creation Checksum: HjzTdymw2dlYa0prJNHCENp3dBsk7x5rznOEURpXcuY= Bid Security: Electronic Bidder's Bond License #: 1033752 California Company, Small Business and Non-Small Business preferences are not applied on Federally funded projects

Letting ID: 01-0E11U4 0720 Letting Date: 07/20/2023 Contract ID: 01-0E11U4 Vendor Name: Ghilotti Construction Co. Cost total: \$16,700,292.98 Days bid: 175 days @ \$10000.00 Cost Per Day Time total: \$1,750,000.00 Bid Amount (Cost+Time): \$18,450,292.98 NOTE: DAYS BID, COST PER DAY, AND TIME TOTAL ARE ONLY REPORTED ON COST + TIME PROJECTS Description: CONSTRUCTION ON STATE HIGHWAY IN MENDOCINO COUNTY NEAR ELK FROM 0.2 MILE SOUTH OF ELK CREEK BRIDGE TO 0.2 MILE NORTH OF ELK CREEK BRIDGE In District 01 On Route 1 CallOrder: 1 Project ID: 0123000069 Amendments: 3 Bid Error Flag: No Bid Errors: Bid Modification Checksum: 21DCBC0839 Bid Creation Checksum: HjzTdymw2dlYa0prJNHCENp3dBsk7x5rznOEURpXcuY= Bid Security: Electronic Bidder's Bond License #: 644515 California Company, Small Business and Non-Small Business preferences are not applied on Federally funded projects

Bid Download Report By Bid Amount

Proposal: 01-0H5604 Call order: 1 Number of bids received: 3

Bidder ID	Vendor Name
VC000000213	Granite Construction Company
VC000003985	Mercer-Fraser Company
VC0000007021	G R Sundberg, Inc.

Letting ID: 01-0H5604 Letting Date: 07/20/2023 Contract ID: 01-0H5604 Vendor Name: Granite Construction Company Cost total: \$12,249,120.50 Days bid: 140 days @ \$9500.00 Cost Per Day Time total: \$1,330,000.00 Bid Amount (Cost+Time): \$13,579,120.50 NOTE: DAYS BID, COST PER DAY, AND TIME TOTAL ARE ONLY REPORTED ON COST + TIME PROJECTS Description: CONSTRUCTION ON STATE HIGHWAY IN HUMBOLDT COUNTY IN AND NEAR ARCATA FROM ROUTE 299/101 SEPARATION TO 0.2 MILE EAST OF BLUE LAKE UNDERCROSSING In District 01 On Route 299 CallOrder: 1 Project ID: 0117000236 Amendments: 2 Bid Error Flag: No Bid Errors: Bid Modification Checksum: DE3850DD12 Bid Creation Checksum: SriDC09n606J/c5QCTYz15b8UK88waexSH59HJplijk= Bid Security: Electronic Bidder's Bond License #: 89 California Company, Small Business and Non-Small Business preferences are not applied on Federally funded projects

Letting ID: 01-0H5604 Letting Date: 07/20/2023 Contract ID: 01-0H5604 Vendor Name: Mercer-Fraser Company Cost total: \$12,263,263.00 Days bid: 140 days @ \$9500.00 Cost Per Day Time total: \$1,330,000.00 Bid Amount (Cost+Time): \$13,593,263.00 NOTE: DAYS BID, COST PER DAY, AND TIME TOTAL ARE ONLY REPORTED ON COST + TIME PROJECTS Description: CONSTRUCTION ON STATE HIGHWAY IN HUMBOLDT COUNTY IN AND NEAR ARCATA FROM ROUTE 299/101 SEPARATION TO 0.2 MILE EAST OF BLUE LAKE UNDERCROSSING In District 01 On Route 299 CallOrder: 1 Project ID: 0117000236 Amendments: 2 Bid Error Flag: No Bid Errors: Bid Modification Checksum: 38593EDEOA Bid Creation Checksum: SriDC09n606J/c5QCTYz15b8UK88waexSH59HJplijk= Bid Security: Electronic Bidder's Bond License #: 105709 California Company, Small Business and Non-Small Business preferences are not applied on Federally funded projects Small Business Preference:

Non-Small Business Preference: California Company Preference: not No

Letting ID: 01-0H5604 Letting Date: 07/20/2023 Contract ID: 01-0H5604 Vendor Name: G R Sundberg, Inc. Cost total: \$12,758,259.00 Days bid: 140 days @ \$9500.00 Cost Per Day Time total: \$1,330,000.00 Bid Amount (Cost+Time): \$14,088,259.00 NOTE: DAYS BID, COST PER DAY, AND TIME TOTAL ARE ONLY REPORTED ON COST + TIME PROJECTS Description: CONSTRUCTION ON STATE HIGHWAY IN HUMBOLDT COUNTY IN AND NEAR ARCATA FROM ROUTE 299/101 SEPARATION TO 0.2 MILE EAST OF BLUE LAKE UNDERCROSSING In District 01 On Route 299 CallOrder: 1 Project ID: 0117000236 Amendments: 2 Bid Error Flag: No Bid Errors: Bid Modification Checksum: 0121FDAAD3 Bid Creation Checksum: SriDC09n606J/c5QCTYz15b8UK88waexSH59HJplijk= Bid Security: Electronic Bidder's Bond License #: 732695 California Company, Small Business and Non-Small Business preferences are not applied on Federally funded projects Small Business Preference:

Non-Small Business Preference: California Company Preference: not No

Bid Download Report By Bid Amount

Proposal: 07-320804 Call order: 1 Number of bids received: 7

Bidder ID	Vendor Name
VC170000908	Alfaro Communications Construction,Inc
VC1600004192	Calpromax Engineering Inc.
VC2100000646	FEC Future Contractors and Engineers, Inc.
VC0000020938	Griffith Company
VC0000021468	DBX, Inc.
VC1300003513	Landscape Support Services
VC1500002285	CT&T Concrete Paving Inc.

Letting ID: 07-320804 0720 Letting Date: 07/20/2023 Contract ID: 07-320804 Vendor Name: Alfaro Communications Construction, Inc Cost total: \$6,643,821.29 Days bid: days @ \$ Cost Per Day Time total: \$0.00 Bid Amount (Cost+Time): \$6,643,821.29 NOTE: DAYS BID, COST PER DAY, AND TIME TOTAL ARE ONLY REPORTED ON COST + TIME PROJECTS Description: CONSTRUCTION ON STATE HIGHWAY IN LOS ANGELES COUNTY IN SOUTH EL MONTE, EL MONTE AND ROSEMEAD AT VARIOUS LOCATIONS ON ROUTE 164 FROM RUSH STREET TO RUDELL UNDERPASS In District 07 On Route 164 CallOrder: 1 Project ID: 0716000042 Amendments: 3 Bid Error Flag: No Bid Errors: Bid Modification Checksum: 112CA8EF65 Bid Creation Checksum: CHE1G9hIiAknvBx0+/wlYshkJkFibnLOnNKZMHVWlLM= Bid Security: Electronic Bidder's Bond License #: 912727 California Company, Small Business and Non-Small Business preferences are not applied on Federally funded projects Small Business Preference: Non-Small Business Preference: California Company Preference: not No

Letting ID: 07-320804 0720 Letting Date: 07/20/2023 Contract ID: 07-320804 Vendor Name: Calpromax Engineering Inc. Cost total: \$7,188,691.90 Days bid: days @ \$ Cost Per Day Time total: \$0.00 Bid Amount (Cost+Time): \$7,188,691.90 NOTE: DAYS BID, COST PER DAY, AND TIME TOTAL ARE ONLY REPORTED ON COST + TIME PROJECTS Description: CONSTRUCTION ON STATE HIGHWAY IN LOS ANGELES COUNTY IN SOUTH EL MONTE, EL MONTE AND ROSEMEAD AT VARIOUS LOCATIONS ON ROUTE 164 FROM RUSH STREET TO RUDELL UNDERPASS In District 07 On Route 164 CallOrder: 1 Project ID: 0716000042 Amendments: 3 Bid Error Flag: No Bid Errors: Bid Modification Checksum: 7AD9701C57 Bid Creation Checksum: CHE1G9hIiAknvBx0+/wlYshkJkFibnLOnNKZMHVWlLM= Bid Security: Bidder's Bond License #: 995933 California Company, Small Business and Non-Small Business preferences are not applied on Federally funded projects Small Business Preference: Non-Small Business Preference: California Company Preference: not No

Letting ID: 07-320804 0720 Letting Date: 07/20/2023 Contract ID: 07-320804 Vendor Name: FEC Future Contractors and Engineers, Inc. Cost total: \$8,774,455.02 Days bid: days @ \$ Cost Per Day Time total: \$0.00 Bid Amount (Cost+Time): \$8,774,455.02 NOTE: DAYS BID, COST PER DAY, AND TIME TOTAL ARE ONLY REPORTED ON COST + TIME PROJECTS Description: CONSTRUCTION ON STATE HIGHWAY IN LOS ANGELES COUNTY IN SOUTH EL MONTE, EL MONTE AND ROSEMEAD AT VARIOUS LOCATIONS ON ROUTE 164 FROM RUSH STREET TO RUDELL UNDERPASS In District 07 On Route 164 CallOrder: 1 Project ID: 0716000042 Amendments: 3 Bid Error Flag: No Bid Errors: Bid Modification Checksum: BB7480A73E Bid Creation Checksum: CHE1G9hIiAknvBx0+/wlYshkJkFibnLOnNKZMHVWlLM= Bid Security: Electronic Bidder's Bond License #: 959988 California Company, Small Business and Non-Small Business preferences are not applied on Federally funded projects Small Business Preference: Non-Small Business Preference: California Company Preference: not No

Letting ID: 07-320804 0720 Letting Date: 07/20/2023 Contract ID: 07-320804 Vendor Name: Griffith Company Cost total: \$8,839,624.66 Days bid: days @ \$ Cost Per Day Time total: \$0.00 Bid Amount (Cost+Time): \$8,839,624.66 NOTE: DAYS BID, COST PER DAY, AND TIME TOTAL ARE ONLY REPORTED ON COST + TIME PROJECTS Description: CONSTRUCTION ON STATE HIGHWAY IN LOS ANGELES COUNTY IN SOUTH EL MONTE, EL MONTE AND ROSEMEAD AT VARIOUS LOCATIONS ON ROUTE 164 FROM RUSH STREET TO RUDELL UNDERPASS In District 07 On Route 164 CallOrder: 1 Project ID: 0716000042 Amendments: 3 Bid Error Flag: No Bid Errors: Bid Modification Checksum: 22EE2F5969 Bid Creation Checksum: CHE1G9hIiAknvBx0+/wlYshkJkFibnLOnNKZMHVWlLM= Bid Security: Electronic Bidder's Bond License #: 88 California Company, Small Business and Non-Small Business preferences are not applied on Federally funded projects Small Business Preference: Non-Small Business Preference: California Company Preference: not No

Letting ID: 07-320804 0720 Letting Date: 07/20/2023 Contract ID: 07-320804 Vendor Name: DBX, Inc. Cost total: \$9,919,203.00 Days bid: days @ \$ Cost Per Day Time total: \$0.00 Bid Amount (Cost+Time): \$9,919,203.00 NOTE: DAYS BID, COST PER DAY, AND TIME TOTAL ARE ONLY REPORTED ON COST + TIME PROJECTS Description: CONSTRUCTION ON STATE HIGHWAY IN LOS ANGELES COUNTY IN SOUTH EL MONTE, EL MONTE AND ROSEMEAD AT VARIOUS LOCATIONS ON ROUTE 164 FROM RUSH STREET TO RUDELL UNDERPASS In District 07 On Route 164 CallOrder: 1 Project ID: 0716000042 Amendments: 3 Bid Error Flag: No Bid Errors: Bid Modification Checksum: 4F3F4EDE3D Bid Creation Checksum: CHE1G9hIiAknvBx0+/wlYshkJkFibnLOnNKZMHVWlLM= Bid Security: Electronic Bidder's Bond License #: 240547 California Company, Small Business and Non-Small Business preferences are not applied on Federally funded projects Small Business Preference: Non-Small Business Preference: California Company Preference: not No

Letting ID: 07-320804 0720 Letting Date: 07/20/2023 Contract ID: 07-320804 Vendor Name: Landscape Support Services Cost total: \$10,867,554.28 Days bid: days @ \$ Cost Per Day Time total: \$0.00 Bid Amount (Cost+Time): \$10,867,554.28 NOTE: DAYS BID, COST PER DAY, AND TIME TOTAL ARE ONLY REPORTED ON COST + TIME PROJECTS Description: CONSTRUCTION ON STATE HIGHWAY IN LOS ANGELES COUNTY IN SOUTH EL MONTE, EL MONTE AND ROSEMEAD AT VARIOUS LOCATIONS ON ROUTE 164 FROM RUSH STREET TO RUDELL UNDERPASS In District 07 On Route 164 CallOrder: 1 Project ID: 0716000042 Amendments: 3 Bid Error Flag: No Bid Errors: Bid Modification Checksum: 7BC35B3CEA Bid Creation Checksum: CHE1G9hIiAknvBx0+/wlYshkJkFibnLOnNKZMHVWlLM= Bid Security: Electronic Bidder's Bond License #: 969552 California Company, Small Business and Non-Small Business preferences are not applied on Federally funded projects Small Business Preference: Non-Small Business Preference: California Company Preference: not No

Letting ID: 07-320804 0720 Letting Date: 07/20/2023 Contract ID: 07-320804 Vendor Name: CT&T Concrete Paving Inc. Cost total: \$11,336,648.90 Days bid: days @ \$ Cost Per Day Time total: \$0.00 Bid Amount (Cost+Time): \$11,336,648.90 NOTE: DAYS BID, COST PER DAY, AND TIME TOTAL ARE ONLY REPORTED ON COST + TIME PROJECTS Description: CONSTRUCTION ON STATE HIGHWAY IN LOS ANGELES COUNTY IN SOUTH EL MONTE, EL MONTE AND ROSEMEAD AT VARIOUS LOCATIONS ON ROUTE 164 FROM RUSH STREET TO RUDELL UNDERPASS In District 07 On Route 164 CallOrder: 1 Project ID: 0716000042 Amendments: 3 Bid Error Flag: No Bid Errors: Bid Modification Checksum: A1F157C120 Bid Creation Checksum: CHE1G9hIiAknvBx0+/wlYshkJkFibnLOnNKZMHVWlLM= Bid Security: Electronic Bidder's Bond License #: 875627 California Company, Small Business and Non-Small Business preferences are not applied on Federally funded projects Small Business Preference: Non-Small Business Preference: California Company Preference: not No