Bid Download Report By Bid Amount

Proposal: 08-1N0504 Call order: 1 Number of bids received: 5

Bidder ID	Vendor Name
VC0000101365	Bowe Contractors Inc.
VC2100001255	EverLevel Holdings, LLC
VC2100001808	bellakai construction
VC2100000646	FEC Future Contractors and Engineers, Inc.
VC1700000908	Alfaro Communications Construction, Inc

Letting ID: 08-1N0504 0830 Letting Date: 08/30/2023 Contract ID: 08-1N0504 Vendor Name: Bowe Contractors Inc. Cost total: \$1,738,586.25 Days bid: days @ \$ Cost Per Day Time total: \$0.00 Bid Amount (Cost+Time): \$1,738,586.25 NOTE: DAYS BID, COST PER DAY, AND TIME TOTAL ARE ONLY REPORTED ON COST + TIME PROJECTS Description: CONSTRUCTION ON STATE HIGHWAY IN SAN BERNARDINO COUNTY NEAR ARIZONA STATE LINE AT 0.1 MILE SOUTH OF PARKER DAM ROAD In District 08 On Route 62 CallOrder: 1 Project ID: 0822000086 Amendments: 1 Bid Error Flag: No Bid Errors: Bid Modification Checksum: FCC40904B0 Bid Creation Checksum: kABvUJQ0AylTzEFZ1No5N00DBBnuM1jSRMhn/OaMiJ0= Bid Security: Electronic Bidder's Bond License #: 778870 California Company, Small Business and Non-Small Business preferences are not applied on Federally funded projects Small Business Preference:requests Non-Small Business Preference:

California Company Preference: not No

Letting ID: 08-1N0504 0830 Letting Date: 08/30/2023 Contract ID: 08-1N0504 Vendor Name: EverLevel Holdings, LLC Cost total: \$1,915,000.00 Days bid: days @ \$ Cost Per Day Time total: \$0.00 Bid Amount (Cost+Time): \$1,915,000.00 NOTE: DAYS BID, COST PER DAY, AND TIME TOTAL ARE ONLY REPORTED ON COST + TIME PROJECTS Description: CONSTRUCTION ON STATE HIGHWAY IN SAN BERNARDINO COUNTY NEAR ARIZONA STATE LINE AT 0.1 MILE SOUTH OF PARKER DAM ROAD In District 08 On Route 62 CallOrder: 1 Project ID: 0822000086 Amendments: 1 Bid Error Flag: No Bid Errors: Bid Modification Checksum: 469F3313C9 Bid Creation Checksum: kABvUJQ0AylTzEFZ1No5N00DBBnuM1jSRMhn/OaMiJ0= Bid Security: Electronic Bidder's Bond License #: 1069011 California Company, Small Business and Non-Small Business preferences are not applied on Federally funded projects Small Business Preference:requests Non-Small Business Preference:

California Company Preference: not No

Letting ID: 08-1N0504 0830 Letting Date: 08/30/2023 Contract ID: 08-1N0504 Vendor Name: bellakai construction Cost total: \$2,298,777.00 Days bid: days @ \$ Cost Per Day Time total: \$0.00 Bid Amount (Cost+Time): \$2,298,777.00 NOTE: DAYS BID, COST PER DAY, AND TIME TOTAL ARE ONLY REPORTED ON COST + TIME PROJECTS Description: CONSTRUCTION ON STATE HIGHWAY IN SAN BERNARDINO COUNTY NEAR ARIZONA STATE LINE AT 0.1 MILE SOUTH OF PARKER DAM ROAD In District 08 On Route 62 CallOrder: 1 Project ID: 0822000086 Amendments: 1 Bid Error Flag: No Bid Errors: Bid Modification Checksum: 74AA9416CF Bid Creation Checksum: kABvUJQ0AylTzEFZ1No5N00DBBnuM1jSRMhn/OaMiJ0= Bid Security: Electronic Bidder's Bond License #: 1046956 California Company, Small Business and Non-Small Business preferences are not applied on Federally funded projects Small Business Preference:requests

Non-Small Business Preference: California Company Preference: not No

Letting ID: 08-1N0504 0830 Letting Date: 08/30/2023 Contract ID: 08-1N0504 Vendor Name: FEC Future Contractors and Engineers, Inc. Cost total: \$2,426,104.56 Days bid: days @ \$ Cost Per Day Time total: \$0.00 Bid Amount (Cost+Time): \$2,426,104.56 NOTE: DAYS BID, COST PER DAY, AND TIME TOTAL ARE ONLY REPORTED ON COST + TIME PROJECTS Description: CONSTRUCTION ON STATE HIGHWAY IN SAN BERNARDINO COUNTY NEAR ARIZONA STATE LINE AT 0.1 MILE SOUTH OF PARKER DAM ROAD In District 08 On Route 62 CallOrder: 1 Project ID: 0822000086 Amendments: 1 Bid Error Flag: No Bid Errors: Bid Modification Checksum: D97DA31539 Bid Creation Checksum: kABvUJQ0AylTzEFZ1No5N00DBBnuM1jSRMhn/OaMiJ0= Bid Security: Electronic Bidder's Bond License #: 959988 California Company, Small Business and Non-Small Business preferences are not applied on Federally funded projects Small Business Preference:requests

Non-Small Business Preference: California Company Preference: not No

Letting ID: 08-1N0504 0830 Letting Date: 08/30/2023 Contract ID: 08-1N0504 Vendor Name: Alfaro Communications Construction, Inc Cost total: \$2,810,642.99 Days bid: days @ \$ Cost Per Day Time total: \$0.00 Bid Amount (Cost+Time): \$2,810,642.99 NOTE: DAYS BID, COST PER DAY, AND TIME TOTAL ARE ONLY REPORTED ON COST + TIME PROJECTS Description: CONSTRUCTION ON STATE HIGHWAY IN SAN BERNARDINO COUNTY NEAR ARIZONA STATE LINE AT 0.1 MILE SOUTH OF PARKER DAM ROAD In District 08 On Route 62 CallOrder: 1 Project ID: 0822000086 Amendments: 1 Bid Error Flag: No Bid Errors: Bid Modification Checksum: 02A7EFFCC8 Bid Creation Checksum: kABvUJQ0AylTzEFZ1No5N00DBBnuM1jSRMhn/OaMiJ0= Bid Security: Electronic Bidder's Bond License #: 912727 California Company, Small Business and Non-Small Business preferences are not applied on Federally funded projects Small Business Preference:requests

Non-Small Business Preference: California Company Preference: not No

Bid Download Report By Bid Amount

Proposal: 10-1H6504 Call order: 1 Number of bids received: 5

Bidder ID	Vendor Name
VC000003717	Marina Landscape Inc.
VC1200006029	WABO Landscape & Construction, Inc.
VC2200003323	DOJA INC.
VC2000003271	Odyssey Environmental Services, Inc.
VC1200002736	CCFG Construction

Letting ID: 10-1H6504 Letting Date: 08/30/2023 Contract ID: 10-1H6504 Vendor Name: Marina Landscape Inc. Cost total: \$3,498,360.00 Days bid: days @ \$ Cost Per Day Time total: \$0.00 Bid Amount (Cost+Time): \$3,498,360.00 NOTE: DAYS BID, COST PER DAY, AND TIME TOTAL ARE ONLY REPORTED ON COST + TIME PROJECTS Description: CONSTRUCTION ON STATE HIGHWAY IN SAN JOAQUIN COUNTY IN AND NEAR LODI FROM 0.4 MILE NORTH OF HARNEY LANE OVERCROSSING TO 0.2 MILE NORTH OF TURNER ROAD OVERCROSSING In District 10 On Route 99 CallOrder: 1 Project ID: 1018000282 Amendments: 1 Bid Error Flag: No Bid Errors: Bid Modification Checksum: 6F3C1A2689 Bid Creation Checksum: pWEbyc6ml23thkJ4539qBKn4kHpT2vz3idVzqL6TJ7U= Bid Security: Electronic Bidder's Bond License #: 492862 California Company, Small Business and Non-Small Business preferences are not applied on Federally funded projects Small Business Preference: Non-Small Business Preference: California Company Preference: not No

Letting ID: 10-1H6504 Letting Date: 08/30/2023 Contract ID: 10-1H6504 Vendor Name: WABO Landscape & Construction, Inc. Cost total: \$3,500,827.00 Days bid: days @ \$ Cost Per Day Time total: \$0.00 Bid Amount (Cost+Time): \$3,500,827.00 NOTE: DAYS BID, COST PER DAY, AND TIME TOTAL ARE ONLY REPORTED ON COST + TIME PROJECTS Description: CONSTRUCTION ON STATE HIGHWAY IN SAN JOAQUIN COUNTY IN AND NEAR LODI FROM 0.4 MILE NORTH OF HARNEY LANE OVERCROSSING TO 0.2 MILE NORTH OF TURNER ROAD OVERCROSSING In District 10 On Route 99 CallOrder: 1 Project ID: 1018000282 Amendments: 1 Bid Error Flag: No Bid Errors: Bid Modification Checksum: 3A7B101DA4 Bid Creation Checksum: pWEbyc6ml23thkJ4539gBKn4kHpT2vz3idVzgL6TJ7U= Bid Security: Electronic Bidder's Bond License #: 962263 California Company, Small Business and Non-Small Business preferences are not applied on Federally funded projects Small Business Preference: Non-Small Business Preference: California Company Preference: not No

Letting ID: 10-1H6504 Letting Date: 08/30/2023 Contract ID: 10-1H6504 Vendor Name: DOJA INC. Cost total: \$3,990,000.00 Days bid: days @ \$ Cost Per Day Time total: \$0.00 Bid Amount (Cost+Time): \$3,990,000.00 NOTE: DAYS BID, COST PER DAY, AND TIME TOTAL ARE ONLY REPORTED ON COST + TIME PROJECTS Description: CONSTRUCTION ON STATE HIGHWAY IN SAN JOAQUIN COUNTY IN AND NEAR LODI FROM 0.4 MILE NORTH OF HARNEY LANE OVERCROSSING TO 0.2 MILE NORTH OF TURNER ROAD OVERCROSSING In District 10 On Route 99 CallOrder: 1 Project ID: 1018000282 Amendments: 1 Bid Error Flag: No Bid Errors: Bid Modification Checksum: B3F652F2EE Bid Creation Checksum: pWEbyc6ml23thkJ4539gBKn4kHpT2vz3idVzgL6TJ7U= Bid Security: Electronic Bidder's Bond License #: 597764 California Company, Small Business and Non-Small Business preferences are not applied on Federally funded projects Small Business Preference: Non-Small Business Preference: California Company Preference: not No

Letting ID: 10-1H6504 Letting Date: 08/30/2023 Contract ID: 10-1H6504 Vendor Name: Odyssey Environmental Services, Inc. Cost total: \$4,410,829.57 Days bid: days @ \$ Cost Per Day Time total: \$0.00 Bid Amount (Cost+Time): \$4,410,829.57 NOTE: DAYS BID, COST PER DAY, AND TIME TOTAL ARE ONLY REPORTED ON COST + TIME PROJECTS Description: CONSTRUCTION ON STATE HIGHWAY IN SAN JOAQUIN COUNTY IN AND NEAR LODI FROM 0.4 MILE NORTH OF HARNEY LANE OVERCROSSING TO 0.2 MILE NORTH OF TURNER ROAD OVERCROSSING In District 10 On Route 99 CallOrder: 1 Project ID: 1018000282 Amendments: 1 Bid Error Flag: No Bid Errors: Bid Modification Checksum: B31BB03897 Bid Creation Checksum: pWEbyc6ml23thkJ4539gBKn4kHpT2vz3idVzgL6TJ7U= Bid Security: Electronic Bidder's Bond License #: 7774370 California Company, Small Business and Non-Small Business preferences are not applied on Federally funded projects Small Business Preference: Non-Small Business Preference: California Company Preference: not No

Letting ID: 10-1H6504 Letting Date: 08/30/2023 Contract ID: 10-1H6504 Vendor Name: CCFG Construction Cost total: \$5,282,864.00 Days bid: days @ \$ Cost Per Day Time total: \$0.00 Bid Amount (Cost+Time): \$5,282,864.00 NOTE: DAYS BID, COST PER DAY, AND TIME TOTAL ARE ONLY REPORTED ON COST + TIME PROJECTS Description: CONSTRUCTION ON STATE HIGHWAY IN SAN JOAQUIN COUNTY IN AND NEAR LODI FROM 0.4 MILE NORTH OF HARNEY LANE OVERCROSSING TO 0.2 MILE NORTH OF TURNER ROAD OVERCROSSING In District 10 On Route 99 CallOrder: 1 Project ID: 1018000282 Amendments: 1 Bid Error Flag: No Bid Errors: Bid Modification Checksum: 50694277E7 Bid Creation Checksum: pWEbyc6ml23thkJ4539gBKn4kHpT2vz3idVzgL6TJ7U= Bid Security: Bidder's Bond License #: 959915 California Company, Small Business and Non-Small Business preferences are not applied on Federally funded projects Small Business Preference: Non-Small Business Preference: California Company Preference: not No