Proposal: 02-4H6604 Call order: 1 Number of bids received: 2

Bidder ID	Vendor Name
VC0000014078	Stimpel-Wiebelhaus Associates, Inc.
VC000007181	S.T.Rhoades Construction, inc.

Letting ID: 02-4H6604 Letting Date: 09/12/2023 Contract ID: 02-4H6604 Vendor Name: Stimpel-Wiebelhaus Associates, Inc. Cost total: \$3,977,006.00 Days bid: 70 days @ \$5200.00 Cost Per Day Time total: \$364,000.00 Bid Amount (Cost+Time): \$4,341,006.00 NOTE: DAYS BID, COST PER DAY, AND TIME TOTAL ARE ONLY REPORTED ON COST + TIME PROJECTS Description: CONSTRUCTION ON STATE HIGHWAY IN SISKIYOU COUNTY AT VARIOUS LOCATIONS FROM 0.3 MILE WEST OF KLAMATH RIVER BRIDGE BR. NO. 02-0119 TO 0.8 MILE EAST OF EMPIRE CREEK In District 02 On Route 96 CallOrder: 1 Project ID: 0219000001 Amendments: 2 Bid Error Flag: No Bid Errors: Bid Modification Checksum: 476EFF5507 Bid Creation Checksum: 7zgKa9AVFiHE7KSls0RU6X43L/ipnZEr36Ru9/75ncs= Bid Security: Electronic Bidder's Bond License #: 605471 California Company, Small Business and Non-Small Business preferences are not applied on Federally funded projects Small Business Preference: Non-Small Business Preference: California Company Preference: not No

Letting ID: 02-4H6604 Letting Date: 09/12/2023 Contract ID: 02-4H6604 Vendor Name: S.T.Rhoades Construction, inc. Cost total: \$4,532,808.00 Days bid: 70 days @ \$5200.00 Cost Per Day Time total: \$364,000.00 Bid Amount (Cost+Time): \$4,896,808.00 NOTE: DAYS BID, COST PER DAY, AND TIME TOTAL ARE ONLY REPORTED ON COST + TIME PROJECTS Description: CONSTRUCTION ON STATE HIGHWAY IN SISKIYOU COUNTY AT VARIOUS LOCATIONS FROM 0.3 MILE WEST OF KLAMATH RIVER BRIDGE BR. NO. 02-0119 TO 0.8 MILE EAST OF EMPIRE CREEK In District 02 On Route 96 CallOrder: 1 Project ID: 0219000001 Amendments: 2 Bid Error Flag: No Bid Errors: Bid Modification Checksum: A8F7569C2C Bid Creation Checksum: 7zqKa9AVFiHE7KSls0RU6X43L/ipnZEr36Ru9/75ncs= Bid Security: Electronic Bidder's Bond License #: 930684 California Company, Small Business and Non-Small Business preferences are not applied on Federally funded projects Small Business Preference: Non-Small Business Preference: California Company Preference: not No

Proposal: 06-1E7604 Call order: 1 Number of bids received: 3

Bidder ID	Vendor Name
VC1200006029	WABO Landscape & Construction, Inc.
VC2100000646	FEC Future Contractors and Engineers, Inc.
VC1300003023	CAL VALLEY CONSTRUCTION, INC.

Letting ID: 06-1E7604 0912 Letting Date: 09/12/2023 Contract ID: 06-1E7604 Vendor Name: WABO Landscape & Construction, Inc. Cost total: \$3,005,979.00 Days bid: days @ \$ Cost Per Day Time total: \$0.00 Bid Amount (Cost+Time): \$3,005,979.00 NOTE: DAYS BID, COST PER DAY, AND TIME TOTAL ARE ONLY REPORTED ON COST + TIME PROJECTS Description: CONSTRUCTION ON STATE HIGHWAY IN FRESNO COUNTY IN FRESNO AT VARIOUS LOCATIONS FROM 0.5 MILE SOUTH OF JENSEN AVENUE OVERCROSSING TO 0.5 MILE NORTH OF AUDUBON DRIVE OVERCROSSING In District 06 On Route 41 CallOrder: 1 Project ID: 0622000078 Amendments: 2 Bid Error Flag: No Bid Errors: Bid Modification Checksum: B47A17D485 Bid Creation Checksum: GyyndKGBulK+D26yiVP6u9FeDAhsnFPGA1NopAdmalM= Bid Security: Electronic Bidder's Bond License #: 962263 California Company, Small Business and Non-Small Business preferences are not applied on Federally funded projects Small Business Preference:requests Non-Small Business Preference: California Company Preference: not No

Letting ID: 06-1E7604 0912 Letting Date: 09/12/2023 Contract ID: 06-1E7604 Vendor Name: FEC Future Contractors and Engineers, Inc. Cost total: \$3,832,421.62 Days bid: days @ \$ Cost Per Day Time total: \$0.00 Bid Amount (Cost+Time): \$3,832,421.62 NOTE: DAYS BID, COST PER DAY, AND TIME TOTAL ARE ONLY REPORTED ON COST + TIME PROJECTS Description: CONSTRUCTION ON STATE HIGHWAY IN FRESNO COUNTY IN FRESNO AT VARIOUS LOCATIONS FROM 0.5 MILE SOUTH OF JENSEN AVENUE OVERCROSSING TO 0.5 MILE NORTH OF AUDUBON DRIVE OVERCROSSING In District 06 On Route 41 CallOrder: 1 Project ID: 0622000078 Amendments: 2 Bid Error Flag: No Bid Errors: Bid Modification Checksum: 435F833BB0 Bid Creation Checksum: GyyndKGBulK+D26yiVP6u9FeDAhsnFPGA1NopAdmalM= Bid Security: Electronic Bidder's Bond License #: 959988 California Company, Small Business and Non-Small Business preferences are not applied on Federally funded projects Small Business Preference:requests Non-Small Business Preference: California Company Preference: not No

Letting ID: 06-1E7604 0912 Letting Date: 09/12/2023 Contract ID: 06-1E7604 Vendor Name: CAL VALLEY CONSTRUCTION, INC. Cost total: \$4,099,088.46 Days bid: days @ \$ Cost Per Day Time total: \$0.00 Bid Amount (Cost+Time): \$4,099,088.46 NOTE: DAYS BID, COST PER DAY, AND TIME TOTAL ARE ONLY REPORTED ON COST + TIME PROJECTS Description: CONSTRUCTION ON STATE HIGHWAY IN FRESNO COUNTY IN FRESNO AT VARIOUS LOCATIONS FROM 0.5 MILE SOUTH OF JENSEN AVENUE OVERCROSSING TO 0.5 MILE NORTH OF AUDUBON DRIVE OVERCROSSING In District 06 On Route 41 CallOrder: 1 Project ID: 0622000078 Amendments: 2 Bid Error Flag: No Bid Errors: Bid Modification Checksum: B2D8DDFFBB Bid Creation Checksum: GyyndKGBulK+D26yiVP6u9FeDAhsnFPGA1NopAdmalM= Bid Security: Electronic Bidder's Bond License #: 873800 California Company, Small Business and Non-Small Business preferences are not applied on Federally funded projects Small Business Preference: Non-Small Business Preference: California Company Preference: not No

Proposal: 08-1N1214 Call order: 1 Number of bids received: 5

Bidder ID	Vendor Name
VC2100001255	EverLevel Holdings, LLC
VC1500005262	My Electrician Inc
VC1400001728	Ferreira Construction Co Inc dba Ferreira Coastal Construction Co
VC000006260	Autobahn Construction, Inc.
VC210000646	FEC Future Contractors and Engineers, Inc.

Letting ID: 08-1N1214 Letting Date: 09/12/2023 Contract ID: 08-1N1214 Vendor Name: EverLevel Holdings, LLC Cost total: \$2,085,923.00 Days bid: days @ \$ Cost Per Day Time total: \$0.00 Bid Amount (Cost+Time): \$2,085,923.00 NOTE: DAYS BID, COST PER DAY, AND TIME TOTAL ARE ONLY REPORTED ON COST + TIME PROJECTS Description: CONSTRUCTION ON STATE HIGHWAY IN SAN BERNARDINO COUNTY ABOUT 43 MILES NORTH OF BAKER AT VARIOUS LOCATIONS FROM 0.5 MILE SOUTH OF YATES WELL ROAD OVERCROSSING TO 0.7 MILE SOUTH OF NEVADA STATE LINE In District 08 On Route 15 CallOrder: 1 Project ID: 0823000023 Amendments: Bid Error Flag: No Bid Errors: Bid Modification Checksum: DEBE69733B Bid Creation Checksum: PAEkLCrODwRyrOE2NSxxccw8q8OSHVyHNWSOt0AoANQ= Bid Security: Electronic Bidder's Bond License #: 1069011 California Company, Small Business and Non-Small Business preferences are not applied on Federally funded projects Small Business Preference:requests Non-Small Business Preference: California Company Preference: not No

Letting ID: 08-1N1214 Letting Date: 09/12/2023 Contract ID: 08-1N1214 Vendor Name: My Electrician Inc Cost total: \$2,595,700.00 Days bid: days @ \$ Cost Per Day Time total: \$0.00 Bid Amount (Cost+Time): \$2,595,700.00 NOTE: DAYS BID, COST PER DAY, AND TIME TOTAL ARE ONLY REPORTED ON COST + TIME PROJECTS Description: CONSTRUCTION ON STATE HIGHWAY IN SAN BERNARDINO COUNTY ABOUT 43 MILES NORTH OF BAKER AT VARIOUS LOCATIONS FROM 0.5 MILE SOUTH OF YATES WELL ROAD OVERCROSSING TO 0.7 MILE SOUTH OF NEVADA STATE LINE In District 08 On Route 15 CallOrder: 1 Project ID: 0823000023 Amendments: Bid Error Flag: No Bid Errors: Bid Modification Checksum: 0520F9FF13 Bid Creation Checksum: PAEkLCrODwRyrOE2NSxxccw8q8OSHVyHNWSOt0AoANQ= Bid Security: Bidder's Bond License #: 1001662 California Company, Small Business and Non-Small Business preferences are not applied on Federally funded projects Small Business Preference: Non-Small Business Preference: California Company Preference: not No

Letting ID: 08-1N1214 Letting Date: 09/12/2023 Contract ID: 08-1N1214 Vendor Name: Ferreira Construction Co Inc dba Ferreira Coastal Construction Co Cost total: \$2,889,921.00 Days bid: days @ \$ Cost Per Day Time total: \$0.00 Bid Amount (Cost+Time): \$2,889,921.00 NOTE: DAYS BID, COST PER DAY, AND TIME TOTAL ARE ONLY REPORTED ON COST + TIME PROJECTS Description: CONSTRUCTION ON STATE HIGHWAY IN SAN BERNARDINO COUNTY ABOUT 43 MILES NORTH OF BAKER AT VARIOUS LOCATIONS FROM 0.5 MILE SOUTH OF YATES WELL ROAD OVERCROSSING TO 0.7 MILE SOUTH OF NEVADA STATE LINE In District 08 On Route 15 CallOrder: 1 Project ID: 0823000023 Amendments: Bid Error Flag: No Bid Errors: Bid Modification Checksum: CB32CD8F03 Bid Creation Checksum: PAEkLCrODwRyrOE2NSxxccw8q8OSHVyHNWSOt0AoANQ= Bid Security: Electronic Bidder's Bond License #: 985180 California Company, Small Business and Non-Small Business preferences are not applied on Federally funded projects Small Business Preference: Non-Small Business Preference: California Company Preference: not No

Letting ID: 08-1N1214 Letting Date: 09/12/2023 Contract ID: 08-1N1214 Vendor Name: Autobahn Construction, Inc. Cost total: \$3,084,130.00 Days bid: days @ \$ Cost Per Day Time total: \$0.00 Bid Amount (Cost+Time): \$3,084,130.00 NOTE: DAYS BID, COST PER DAY, AND TIME TOTAL ARE ONLY REPORTED ON COST + TIME PROJECTS Description: CONSTRUCTION ON STATE HIGHWAY IN SAN BERNARDINO COUNTY ABOUT 43 MILES NORTH OF BAKER AT VARIOUS LOCATIONS FROM 0.5 MILE SOUTH OF YATES WELL ROAD OVERCROSSING TO 0.7 MILE SOUTH OF NEVADA STATE LINE In District 08 On Route 15 CallOrder: 1 Project ID: 0823000023 Amendments: Bid Error Flag: No Bid Errors: Bid Modification Checksum: 056C523243 Bid Creation Checksum: PAEkLCrODwRyrOE2NSxxccw8q8OSHVyHNWSOt0AoANQ= Bid Security: Bidder's Bond License #: 676837 California Company, Small Business and Non-Small Business preferences are not applied on Federally funded projects Small Business Preference:requests Non-Small Business Preference: California Company Preference: not No

Letting ID: 08-1N1214 Letting Date: 09/12/2023 Contract ID: 08-1N1214 Vendor Name: FEC Future Contractors and Engineers, Inc. Cost total: \$3,330,485.96 Days bid: days @ \$ Cost Per Day Time total: \$0.00 Bid Amount (Cost+Time): \$3,330,485.96 NOTE: DAYS BID, COST PER DAY, AND TIME TOTAL ARE ONLY REPORTED ON COST + TIME PROJECTS Description: CONSTRUCTION ON STATE HIGHWAY IN SAN BERNARDINO COUNTY ABOUT 43 MILES NORTH OF BAKER AT VARIOUS LOCATIONS FROM 0.5 MILE SOUTH OF YATES WELL ROAD OVERCROSSING TO 0.7 MILE SOUTH OF NEVADA STATE LINE In District 08 On Route 15 CallOrder: 1 Project ID: 0823000023 Amendments: Bid Error Flag: No Bid Errors: Bid Modification Checksum: 7C1E7C047D Bid Creation Checksum: PAEkLCrODwRyrOE2NSxxccw8q8OSHVyHNWSOt0AoANQ= Bid Security: Electronic Bidder's Bond License #: 959988 California Company, Small Business and Non-Small Business preferences are not applied on Federally funded projects Small Business Preference:requests Non-Small Business Preference: California Company Preference: not No

Proposal: 11-2N1424 Call order: 1 Number of bids received: 4

Bidder ID	Vendor Name
VC0000017316	Truesdell Corporation of California, Inc.
VC000007931	Peterson-Chase General Engineering Construction, Inc.
VC1800002280	Myers & Sons Construction, LLC
VC1700004388	American Civil Constructors West Coast LLC

Letting ID: 11-2N1424 Letting Date: 09/12/2023 Contract ID: 11-2N1424 Vendor Name: Truesdell Corporation of California, Inc. Cost total: \$2,197,197.00 Days bid: days @ \$ Cost Per Day Time total: \$0.00 Bid Amount (Cost+Time): \$2,197,197.00 NOTE: DAYS BID, COST PER DAY, AND TIME TOTAL ARE ONLY REPORTED ON COST + TIME PROJECTS Description: CONSTRUCTION ON STATE HIGHWAY IN SAN DIEGO COUNTY IN SANTEE ON ROUTE 52 AT SAN DIEGO RIVER-HOLLINS LAKE BRIDGE AND IN LA MESA ON ROUTE 125 AT PANORAMA DRIVE UNDERCROSSING. In District 11 On Route 52,125 CallOrder: 1 Project ID: 1121000265 Amendments: Bid Error Flag: No Bid Errors: Bid Modification Checksum: E93B8FB019 Bid Creation Checksum: Gf0fq5tQOyfeVQBx0UoHEmYR/7e7+K8YBVLnqEJW51A= Bid Security: Bidder's Bond License #: 615058 California Company, Small Business and Non-Small Business preferences are not applied on Federally funded projects Small Business Preference: Non-Small Business Preference: California Company Preference: not No

Letting ID: 11-2N1424 Letting Date: 09/12/2023 Contract ID: 11-2N1424 Vendor Name: Peterson-Chase General Engineering Construction, Inc. Cost total: \$2,360,100.60 Days bid: days @ \$ Cost Per Day Time total: \$0.00 Bid Amount (Cost+Time): \$2,360,100.60 NOTE: DAYS BID, COST PER DAY, AND TIME TOTAL ARE ONLY REPORTED ON COST + TIME PROJECTS Description: CONSTRUCTION ON STATE HIGHWAY IN SAN DIEGO COUNTY IN SANTEE ON ROUTE 52 AT SAN DIEGO RIVER-HOLLINS LAKE BRIDGE AND IN LA MESA ON ROUTE 125 AT PANORAMA DRIVE UNDERCROSSING. In District 11 On Route 52,125 CallOrder: 1 Project ID: 1121000265 Amendments: Bid Error Flag: No Bid Errors: Bid Modification Checksum: 272AD4E5C7 Bid Creation Checksum: Gf0fq5tQOyfeVQBx0UoHEmYR/7e7+K8YBVLnqEJW51A= Bid Security: Electronic Bidder's Bond License #: 615876 California Company, Small Business and Non-Small Business preferences are not applied on Federally funded projects Small Business Preference: Non-Small Business Preference: California Company Preference: not No

Letting ID: 11-2N1424 Letting Date: 09/12/2023 Contract ID: 11-2N1424 Vendor Name: Myers & Sons Construction, LLC Cost total: \$3,089,998.00 Days bid: days @ \$ Cost Per Day Time total: \$0.00 Bid Amount (Cost+Time): \$3,089,998.00 NOTE: DAYS BID, COST PER DAY, AND TIME TOTAL ARE ONLY REPORTED ON COST + TIME PROJECTS Description: CONSTRUCTION ON STATE HIGHWAY IN SAN DIEGO COUNTY IN SANTEE ON ROUTE 52 AT SAN DIEGO RIVER-HOLLINS LAKE BRIDGE AND IN LA MESA ON ROUTE 125 AT PANORAMA DRIVE UNDERCROSSING. In District 11 On Route 52,125 CallOrder: 1 Project ID: 1121000265 Amendments: Bid Error Flag: No Bid Errors: Bid Modification Checksum: 1CBCF35070 Bid Creation Checksum: Gf0fq5tQOyfeVQBx0UoHEmYR/7e7+K8YBVLnqEJW51A= Bid Security: Electronic Bidder's Bond License #: 1033752 California Company, Small Business and Non-Small Business preferences are not applied on Federally funded projects Small Business Preference: Non-Small Business Preference: California Company Preference: not No

Letting ID: 11-2N1424 Letting Date: 09/12/2023 Contract ID: 11-2N1424 Vendor Name: American Civil Constructors West Coast LLC Cost total: \$3,125,000.00 Days bid: days @ \$ Cost Per Day Time total: \$0.00 Bid Amount (Cost+Time): \$3,125,000.00 NOTE: DAYS BID, COST PER DAY, AND TIME TOTAL ARE ONLY REPORTED ON COST + TIME PROJECTS Description: CONSTRUCTION ON STATE HIGHWAY IN SAN DIEGO COUNTY IN SANTEE ON ROUTE 52 AT SAN DIEGO RIVER-HOLLINS LAKE BRIDGE AND IN LA MESA ON ROUTE 125 AT PANORAMA DRIVE UNDERCROSSING. In District 11 On Route 52,125 CallOrder: 1 Project ID: 1121000265 Amendments: Bid Error Flag: No Bid Errors: Bid Modification Checksum: D99D1EACBA Bid Creation Checksum: Gf0fq5tQOyfeVQBx0UoHEmYR/7e7+K8YBVLnqEJW51A= Bid Security: Electronic Bidder's Bond License #: 1011546 California Company, Small Business and Non-Small Business preferences are not applied on Federally funded projects Small Business Preference: Non-Small Business Preference: California Company Preference: not No