Bid Download Report By Bid Amount

Proposal: 04-1J5674 Call order: 1 Number of bids received: 2

Bidder ID	Vendor Name
VC000003717	Marina Landscape Inc.
VC1200002869	Bortolussi & Watkin, Inc.

Letting ID: 04-1J5674 0919 Letting Date: 09/19/2023 Contract ID: 04-1J5674 Vendor Name: Marina Landscape Inc. Cost total: \$5,958,858.50 Days bid: days @ \$ Cost Per Day Time total: \$0.00 Bid Amount (Cost+Time): \$5,958,858.50 NOTE: DAYS BID, COST PER DAY, AND TIME TOTAL ARE ONLY REPORTED ON COST + TIME PROJECTS Description: CONSTRUCTION ON STATE HIGHWAY IN SANTA CLARA AND SAN MATEO COUNTIES AT VARIOUS LOCATIONS FROM 0.3 MILE SOUTH OF OREGON EXPRESSWAY OVERCROSSING TO 0.3 MILE SOUTH OF AIRPORT TERMINAL OFFRAMP In District 04 On Route 101 CallOrder: 1 Project ID: 0420000048 Amendments: 5 Bid Error Flag: No Bid Errors: Bid Modification Checksum: BC6F3A7A03 Bid Creation Checksum: hzGj6PM5WDtj1q8QKOO/Jd3PxOPHdptXMwdyrrcA0RA= Bid Security: Electronic Bidder's Bond License #: 492862 California Company, Small Business and Non-Small Business preferences are not applied on Federally funded projects Small Business Preference: Non-Small Business Preference: California Company Preference: not No

Letting ID: 04-1J5674 0919 Letting Date: 09/19/2023 Contract ID: 04-1J5674 Vendor Name: Bortolussi & Watkin, Inc. Cost total: \$6,546,518.20 Days bid: days @ \$ Cost Per Day Time total: \$0.00 Bid Amount (Cost+Time): \$6,546,518.20 NOTE: DAYS BID, COST PER DAY, AND TIME TOTAL ARE ONLY REPORTED ON COST + TIME PROJECTS Description: CONSTRUCTION ON STATE HIGHWAY IN SANTA CLARA AND SAN MATEO COUNTIES AT VARIOUS LOCATIONS FROM 0.3 MILE SOUTH OF OREGON EXPRESSWAY OVERCROSSING TO 0.3 MILE SOUTH OF AIRPORT TERMINAL OFFRAMP In District 04 On Route 101 CallOrder: 1 Project ID: 0420000048 Amendments: 5 Bid Error Flag: No Bid Errors: Bid Modification Checksum: 9D4C92C575 Bid Creation Checksum: hzGj6PM5WDtj1q8QKOO/Jd3PxOPHdptXMwdyrrcA0RA= Bid Security: Electronic Bidder's Bond License #: 962905 California Company, Small Business and Non-Small Business preferences are not applied on Federally funded projects Small Business Preference:requests Non-Small Business Preference: California Company Preference: not No

Bid Download Report By Bid Amount

Proposal: 07-330304 Call order: 1 Number of bids received: 2

Bidder ID	Vendor Name
VC210000646	FEC Future Contractors and Engineers, Inc.
VC2000002961	Nationwide Contracting Services inc, DBA Nationwide General Construction Services

Letting ID: 07-330304 0919 Letting Date: 09/19/2023 Contract ID: 07-330304 Vendor Name: FEC Future Contractors and Engineers, Inc. Cost total: \$6,909,012.12 Days bid: days @ \$ Cost Per Day Time total: \$0.00 Bid Amount (Cost+Time): \$6,909,012.12 NOTE: DAYS BID, COST PER DAY, AND TIME TOTAL ARE ONLY REPORTED ON COST + TIME PROJECTS Description: CONSTRUCTION ON STATE HIGHWAY IN LOS ANGELES COUNTY AT VARIOUS LOCATIONS FROM 0.6 MILE EAST OF ROUTE 710/10 SEPARATION TO 0.3 MILE WEST OF ROUTE 10/605 SEPARATION In District 07 On Route 10 CallOrder: 1 Project ID: 0716000213 Amendments: 2 Bid Error Flag: No Bid Errors: Bid Modification Checksum: FD12170EF7 Bid Creation Checksum: zf6kWYsLFMbPMF356aqnuBV6Mb8WtMiJdsnhKT/RiHc= Bid Security: Electronic Bidder's Bond License #: 959988 California Company, Small Business and Non-Small Business preferences are not applied on Federally funded projects Small Business Preference: Non-Small Business Preference: California Company Preference: not No

Letting ID: 07-330304 0919 Letting Date: 09/19/2023 Contract ID: 07-330304 Vendor Name: Nationwide Contracting Services inc, DBA Nationwide General Construction Services Cost total: \$8,077,695.20 Days bid: days @ \$ Cost Per Day Time total: \$0.00 Bid Amount (Cost+Time): \$8,077,695.20 NOTE: DAYS BID, COST PER DAY, AND TIME TOTAL ARE ONLY REPORTED ON COST + TIME PROJECTS Description: CONSTRUCTION ON STATE HIGHWAY IN LOS ANGELES COUNTY AT VARIOUS LOCATIONS FROM 0.6 MILE EAST OF ROUTE 710/10 SEPARATION TO 0.3 MILE WEST OF ROUTE 10/605 SEPARATION In District 07 On Route 10 CallOrder: 1 Project ID: 0716000213 Amendments: 2 Bid Error Flag: No Bid Errors: Bid Modification Checksum: 0E7F2F6FF8 Bid Creation Checksum: zf6kWYsLFMbPMF356aqnuBV6Mb8WtMiJdsnhKT/RiHc= Bid Security: Electronic Bidder's Bond License #: 1031246 California Company, Small Business and Non-Small Business preferences are not applied on Federally funded projects Small Business Preference: Non-Small Business Preference: California Company Preference: not No

Bid Download Report By Bid Amount

Proposal: 08-1J9104 Call order: 1 Number of bids received: 6

Bidder ID	Vendor Name
VC0000101310	Powell Constructors Inc
VC1200001415	YAKAR
VC000007931	Peterson-Chase General Engineering Construction, Inc.
VC0000108807	Kanaan Construction Inc.
VC170000908	Alfaro Communications Construction, Inc
VC2100000646	FEC Future Contractors and Engineers, Inc.

Letting ID: 08-1J9104 Letting Date: 09/19/2023 Contract ID: 08-1J9104 Vendor Name: Powell Constructors Inc Cost total: \$5,924,922.50 Days bid: days @ \$ Cost Per Day Time total: \$0.00 Bid Amount (Cost+Time): \$5,924,922.50 NOTE: DAYS BID, COST PER DAY, AND TIME TOTAL ARE ONLY REPORTED ON COST + TIME PROJECTS Description: CONSTRUCTION ON STATE HIGHWAY IN RIVERSIDE AND SAN BERNARDINO COUNTIES AT VARIOUS LOCATIONS In District 08 On Route 10, 15, 60, 62, 91, etc. CallOrder: 1 Project ID: 0818000135 Amendments: 1 Bid Error Flag: No Bid Errors: Bid Modification Checksum: 5911CA6106 Bid Creation Checksum: DH3jlKTflaDcVq++LVdRMbj38jPCx5WZc+p/fDb1FRc= Bid Security: Electronic Bidder's Bond License #: 845305 A California Company, Small Business and Non-Small Business preferences are not applied on Federally funded projects Small Business Preference: Non-Small Business Preference: California Company Preference: not No

Letting ID: 08-1J9104 Letting Date: 09/19/2023 Contract ID: 08-1J9104 Vendor Name: YAKAR Cost total: \$6,593,024.45 Days bid: days @ \$ Cost Per Day Time total: \$0.00 Bid Amount (Cost+Time): \$6,593,024.45 NOTE: DAYS BID, COST PER DAY, AND TIME TOTAL ARE ONLY REPORTED ON COST + TIME PROJECTS Description: CONSTRUCTION ON STATE HIGHWAY IN RIVERSIDE AND SAN BERNARDINO COUNTIES AT VARIOUS LOCATIONS In District 08 On Route 10, 15, 60, 62, 91, etc. CallOrder: 1 Project ID: 0818000135 Amendments: 1 Bid Error Flag: No Bid Errors: Bid Modification Checksum: A15C85C246 Bid Creation Checksum: DH3jlKTflaDcVq++LVdRMbj38jPCx5WZc+p/fDb1FRc= Bid Security: Electronic Bidder's Bond License #: 909978 California Company, Small Business and Non-Small Business preferences are not applied on Federally funded projects Small Business Preference:requests Non-Small Business Preference: California Company Preference: not No

Letting ID: 08-1J9104 Letting Date: 09/19/2023 Contract ID: 08-1J9104 Vendor Name: Peterson-Chase General Engineering Construction, Inc. Cost total: \$6,874,867.00 Days bid: days @ \$ Cost Per Day Time total: \$0.00 Bid Amount (Cost+Time): \$6,874,867.00 NOTE: DAYS BID, COST PER DAY, AND TIME TOTAL ARE ONLY REPORTED ON COST + TIME PROJECTS Description: CONSTRUCTION ON STATE HIGHWAY IN RIVERSIDE AND SAN BERNARDINO COUNTIES AT VARIOUS LOCATIONS In District 08 On Route 10, 15, 60, 62, 91, etc. CallOrder: 1 Project ID: 0818000135 Amendments: 1 Bid Error Flag: No Bid Errors: Bid Modification Checksum: 58953CF17E Bid Creation Checksum: DH3jlKTflaDcVq++LVdRMbj38jPCx5WZc+p/fDb1FRc= Bid Security: Electronic Bidder's Bond License #: 615876 California Company, Small Business and Non-Small Business preferences are not applied on Federally funded projects Small Business Preference: Non-Small Business Preference: California Company Preference: not No

Letting ID: 08-1J9104 Letting Date: 09/19/2023 Contract ID: 08-1J9104 Vendor Name: Kanaan Construction Inc. Cost total: \$6,883,743.00 Days bid: days @ \$ Cost Per Day Time total: \$0.00 Bid Amount (Cost+Time): \$6,883,743.00 NOTE: DAYS BID, COST PER DAY, AND TIME TOTAL ARE ONLY REPORTED ON COST + TIME PROJECTS Description: CONSTRUCTION ON STATE HIGHWAY IN RIVERSIDE AND SAN BERNARDINO COUNTIES AT VARIOUS LOCATIONS In District 08 On Route 10, 15, 60, 62, 91, etc. CallOrder: 1 Project ID: 0818000135 Amendments: 1 Bid Error Flag: No Bid Errors: Bid Modification Checksum: 245379267C Bid Creation Checksum: DH3jlKTflaDcVq++LVdRMbj38jPCx5WZc+p/fDb1FRc= Bid Security: Electronic Bidder's Bond License #: 870156 California Company, Small Business and Non-Small Business preferences are not applied on Federally funded projects Small Business Preference:requests Non-Small Business Preference: California Company Preference: not No

Letting ID: 08-1J9104 Letting Date: 09/19/2023 Contract ID: 08-1J9104 Vendor Name: Alfaro Communications Construction, Inc Cost total: \$6,935,339.15 Days bid: days @ \$ Cost Per Day Time total: \$0.00 Bid Amount (Cost+Time): \$6,935,339.15 NOTE: DAYS BID, COST PER DAY, AND TIME TOTAL ARE ONLY REPORTED ON COST + TIME PROJECTS Description: CONSTRUCTION ON STATE HIGHWAY IN RIVERSIDE AND SAN BERNARDINO COUNTIES AT VARIOUS LOCATIONS In District 08 On Route 10, 15, 60, 62, 91, etc. CallOrder: 1 Project ID: 0818000135 Amendments: 1 Bid Error Flag: No Bid Errors: Bid Modification Checksum: 2E82D65CEA Bid Creation Checksum: DH3jlKTflaDcVq++LVdRMbj38jPCx5WZc+p/fDb1FRc= Bid Security: Electronic Bidder's Bond License #: 912727 California Company, Small Business and Non-Small Business preferences are not applied on Federally funded projects Small Business Preference:requests Non-Small Business Preference: California Company Preference: not No

Letting ID: 08-1J9104 Letting Date: 09/19/2023 Contract ID: 08-1J9104 Vendor Name: FEC Future Contractors and Engineers, Inc. Cost total: \$9,224,274.80 Days bid: days @ \$ Cost Per Day Time total: \$0.00 Bid Amount (Cost+Time): \$9,224,274.80 NOTE: DAYS BID, COST PER DAY, AND TIME TOTAL ARE ONLY REPORTED ON COST + TIME PROJECTS Description: CONSTRUCTION ON STATE HIGHWAY IN RIVERSIDE AND SAN BERNARDINO COUNTIES AT VARIOUS LOCATIONS In District 08 On Route 10, 15, 60, 62, 91, etc. CallOrder: 1 Project ID: 0818000135 Amendments: 1 Bid Error Flag: No Bid Errors: Bid Modification Checksum: 40CBA194C0 Bid Creation Checksum: DH3jlKTflaDcVq++LVdRMbj38jPCx5WZc+p/fDb1FRc= Bid Security: Electronic Bidder's Bond License #: 959988 California Company, Small Business and Non-Small Business preferences are not applied on Federally funded projects Small Business Preference:requests Non-Small Business Preference: California Company Preference: not No